If you <u>do not</u> intend to submit a bid on these goods and/or service, please return this form to <u>purchasing@cityofnorthport.com</u> or fax to 941.429.7173.

	e undersigned have declined to submit a bid on the requested service Request for Bid # RFB NO. 2019-56 FLOW INSTALLATION, TESTING, AND REPAIR/REPLACEMENT SERVICES for the following reason(s):
	Insufficient time to respond to the Request for Bid.
	We do not offer this service.
	Our schedule would not permit us to perform.
	Unable to meet bond/insurance requirements.
	Specifications are unclear (explain below).
\boxtimes	OTHER (please specify below).
2 Note: COMP ADDR CITY: TELEP E-MAI	Ne are not in the Local Proference Area. We are cortified by ASSE which is accepted every Kere but North Port We performed back flow testing under contract to North Port a couple of Years ago. PANY NAME: Apollo Construction & Engineering Services, Inc. ESS: 1821 26th St NE Ruskin STATE: FL ZIP CODE: 33570 HONE: 813-645-4926 FAX: 813-645-3351 ILL: Ekamprath @ apollo-construction.com ATURE: Description of Company of C

Note: "Statement of No Bid" may be faxed or e-mailed to the Purchasing Division at <a href="mailed-europeans-common faxed-europeans-common faxed-europeans-commo

Page 4 of 53 Request for Bid No. 2019-56

If you <u>do not</u> intend to submit a bid on these goods and/or service, please return this form to <u>purchasing@cityofnorthport.com</u> or fax to 941.429.7173.

BACKFLOW INSTALLATION, TESTING, AND REPAIR/REPLACEMENT SERVICES for the following reason(s):			
	Insufficient time to respond to the Request for Bid.		
	We do not offer this service.		
×	Our schedule would not permit us to perform.		
	Unable to meet bond/insurance requirements.		
	Specifications are unclear (explain below).		
	OTHER (please specify below).		
Remark	SS		
COMPANY NAME: Babe's Plumbing, Inc			
ADDRE	SS: 105 Bluegrass Court		
	lokomis STATE: FL ZIP CODE: 34275		
TELEPHONE: 941-488-2402 FAX: 941-488-4693			
E-MAIL: josh@babesplumbing.com			
SIGNATURE: <u>Joshua T Dalton</u> DATE: 2/21/2019			

Note: "Statement of No Bid" may be faxed or e-mailed to the Purchasing Division at purchasing@cityofnorthport.com or faxed to 941.429.7173.

CITY OF NORTH PORT REQUEST FOR 81D NO. 2019-56 BACKFLOW INSTALLATION, TESTING, AND REPAIR/REPLACEMENT SERVICES

STATEMENT OF NON-SUBMITTAL

If you do not intend to submit a bid on these goods and/or service, please return this form to purchasing@cityofnorthport.com or fax to 941.429.7173.

We the undersigned have declined to submit a bid on the requested service Request for Bid # RFB NO. 2019-56 BACKFLOW INSTALLATION, TESTING, AND REPAIR/REPLACEMENT SERVICES for the following reason(s): Insufficient time to respond to the Request for Bid. We do not offer this service. Our schedule would not permit us to perform. Unable to meet bond/insurance requirements. Specifications are unclear (explain below). OTHER (please specify below). Remarks__ COMPANY NAME: J.C. Little Plumbing Inc. Albin Ave. 2121 FAX: 941

Note: "Statement of No Bid" may be faxed or e-mailed to the Purchasing Division at <u>purchasing@cityofnorthport.com</u> or faxed to 941.429.7173.

Page 4 of 53 Request for Bid No. 2019-56

If you <u>do not</u> intend to submit a bid on these goods and/or service, please return this form to <u>purchasing@cityofnorthport.com</u> or fax to 941.429.7173.

BACKFLOW INSTALLATION, TESTING, AND REPAIR/REPLACEMENT SERVICES for the following reason(s):		
Insufficient time to respond to the Request for Bid.		
We do not offer this service.		
Our schedule would not permit us to perform.		
Unable to meet bond/insurance requirements.		
Specifications are unclear (explain below).		
OTHER (please specify below).		
Remarks	(
COMPANY NAME: <u>Casey's Plumbing</u> ADDRESS: 7282 55th Ave E PMB 241		
D. C. Landala		
TELEPHONE: 941-739-6582 FAX: 941-866-7381		
E-MAIL: jfox/7/@msn.com		
DATE: 3-1-19		
Note: "Statement of N. Pi-III		

Note: "Statement of No Bid" may be faxed or e-mailed to the Purchasing Division at purchasing@cityofnorthport.com or faxed to 941.429.7173.

 $\begin{array}{c} \text{Page 4 of 53} \\ \text{Request for Bid No. 2019-56} \end{array}$

If you do not intend to submit a bid on these goods and/or service, please return this form to purchasing@cityofnorthport.com or fax to 941.429.7173.

We the undersigned have declined to submit a bid on the requested service Request for Bid # RFB NO. 2019-56 BACKFLOW INSTALLATION, TESTING, AND REPAIR/REPLACEMENT SERVICES for the following reason(s):

R	Insufficient time to respond to the Request for Bid.	
	We do not offer this service.	
	Our schedule would not permit us to perform.	
	Unable to meet bond/insurance requirements.	
	Specifications are unclear (explain below).	
	OTHER (please specify below).	
Remarks Missed Rebid meeting but to Surgery on But		
ADDR CITY: TELEP	ESS: 5180 troth Circle. Porth Porth STATE: Fla zipcode: 34287 HONE: 423 7294 FAX: 11: bowersoxinc@concastract 11: bowersoxinc@concastract 11: 10	
SIGN	ATURE: B- Constant DATE: 2-11-19	

Note: "Statement of No Bid" may be faxed or e-mailed to the Purchasing Division at purchasing@cityofnorthport.com or faxed to 941.429.7173.

Page 4 of 53 Request for Bid No. 2019-56