Price Quote Form (PQF)- Motor Vehicles

Contract No.:

25100000-16-1.

Updated 6/1/17

(STATE AGENCIES MUST ALSO SUBMIT MP6301)

Awarded Contractor Information

Vendor Name: (Drop Down) Garber Ford Inc.
Street Address: 3380 Highway 17
City, State, Zip: Green Cove Springs, FL 32043
Contact Person: Ryan Davis [Title: Fleet Sales
Original Quote Date: 8/8/2017 | Revised Quote Date: Est. Delivery: | 90-120 Days
Phone #'s: |Primary: 904-264-2442 Secondary:
Email Address: rdavis@garberautomall.com
Fax #: 904-284-0054
Requesting Agency Information
Agency Name: City of North Port
Contact Person: Judith Fauly [Title: [
Phone #'s: 941.240.8540
Email Address: jfauly@cityofnorthport.com
Fax #:
Secondary Contact for Agency: (optional)
Contact Person: [Title:
Phone #'s:
Email Address:
Fax #:
ComL:nl\t{)?jI:ti%ode Vehicle Group (Drop Down) Line No. Sub Group
25101507 Group 4: Light Trucks or Sport llgtility Vf-:hicles; Sub-Groups A-B 77 Sub-Group B: SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 4WD [INCLUDING ALL
Sports Utility Vehicle WHEEL DRIVE ("AWD")]
Representative Model Description Base Vehicle Price OEM Options Discount %
2018 Ford Explorer 4WD 4dr Base (K8B) $ 26,044.00 4.00%
Manufactu_rer S A MSRP OEM Options Total Discount Option Total Cost with
OEM Option Description St it Discount % Dollars Applied Discount
Code(s) ’

100A EQUIPMENT GROUP 100A $ - - -
998 ENGINE: 3.5L TI-VCT V6 (FFV) $ - - -
44] TRANSMISSION: 6-SPEED SELECTSHIFT AUTOMATIC $ - 2 -
YZ OXFORD WHITE $ - - -
7L MEDIUM LIGHT CAMEL, CLOTH BUCKET SEATS $ - - -
153 FRONT LICENSE PLATE BRACKET $ - 2 =
2018 Carryover Pricing; 2018 Model at 2017 Contract Price = =

o|o|o|o|o|o(o|o|o|o|o|o|o|o|o|o|o|o|o|o

TOTAL COST: OEM OPTIONS

AR |P| PP || PR R R |h PP ||| R |r|r|h|h |
'

SUB-TOTAL

Bl | |n|a|r|n|n|r|v|v|v|n|n|n|o|oa|ea|ea|ea|ea|e

26,044.00



mailto:rdavis@garberautomall.com
mailto:jfauly@cityofnorthport.com

Identified

Aftermarket Description $M#i|:; MSRP CIiolscount TotaDIollbllas::sount Op:g;lgét%lig::::\:nh
Option(s) ’
$ $ =
$ $ =
$ $ =
$ $ =
$ $ =
$ $ =
$ $ =
$ $ =
TOTAL COST: IDENTIFIED AFTERMARKET OPTIONS $ o $ o
IR IR P MSRP MSRP Discount | Total Discount Option Total Cost with
Aftermarket Description $H HH % Dollars Applied Discount
Option(s) ’
TINT LEGAL TINT ALL AROUND NO STRIP $ 299.00 $ = $ 299.00
3K ADDITIONAL KEY WITH FOB $ 246.00 $ = $ 246.00
4C VERTEX 4-CORNER SUPER LED STROBES (Clear) $ 496.00 $ = $ 496.00
INSTALL LABOR FOR VERTEX INSTALLATION INCLUDING CAB $ 210.00 $ = $ 210.00
MOUNTED LED ROCKER SWITCH (2hr x $105) $ = $ o
YTAG YELLOW CITY TAG $ 116.55 $ = $ 116.55
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
TOTAL COST: NON-IDENTIFIED AFTERMARKET OPTIONS $ o $ 1,367.55
GRAND TOTAL PER REPRESENTATIVE MODEL $ 27,411.55
$0.00
Total Vehicles Quoted (Drop Down) 1
PO GRAND TOTAL $27,411.55
Vendor
Comments:
Please confirm vehicle color. If no color is specified then the default is white.
Agency
Comments:

*UNSPSC = United Nations Standard Products and Services Commodity Code

Revised 08-2015 DMS




25100000-16-1 MOTOR VEHICLES
Attachment D.4 - Price Sheet - Light Trucks and Sport Utility Vehicles

Sub-Groups A-B: Sport Utility Vehicles

Commodity Code No. 25101507; LIGHT TRUCKS AND SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES

Updated 5/2/17

To review more information about EPA Fuel Economy please go to:

https://www.fueleconomy.gov/

Please see the Info Sheet for Instructions, General Information, and reference Key.

*****NOTE: THE PRICE SHEET IS NOT COMPLETE UNLESS IT IS USED IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE COMPLETE REQUIREMENTS, SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS, AND

CONDITIONS.*****
oEm Identified Aftermarket Options'’
Manufacturer/ Alternate Base Vehicle Options Estimated
Line i -time i 0 p o 5 n
Sub-Group1 EPA/ Industry Class? 3 Number Representative Model* Fuel Organization Name® Price ($i#,#:4.00) Discount Lead-time in | vent/ Rain Shields, |  Vent/Rain. Receiver / Hitch.
Brand Capables 7 8 | Days (m)‘“ Flange Mounted. ields, Tape-On, | Package, Price
(##%) Price ($####) Price ($#.###)
Sub-Group A: SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck 19,912.00 5% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
WD 1 |2017 Chevrolet Equinox FWD 4dr LS (1LF26) s arber Lhevrolet Fontiac Tuc ¥ il OEY| G $
2wp Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMIC Cadillac $20,432.00 5% 60120 | $ 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck 21,204.00 3% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
Chevrolet 2 |2017 Chevrolet Equinox FWD 4dr LT (1LH26) s arber Lhevrolet Fontiac Tuc 2 il OEY| G $
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMIC Cadillac $21,403.00 5% 60120 | $ 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
3 2017 Chevrolet Trax FWD 4dr LS wiLS (1JU76) Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $18,017.00 5% 90-120 NoBid | § 12600 § 596.00
4 |2017 Chevrolet Trax FWD 4dr LT (1JV76) Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $20,122.00 3% 90-120 NoBid | § 12600 § 596.00
Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. 16,966.00 3% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
5  |2017 Dodge Journey FWD 4dr SE (JCDH49) arber Lhrysler Dodge Truck, nc. ¥ il OEY| O $
Dodge AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $17,385.00 5% 6090 | 175.00 | 5 165.00 | § 585.00
6 |2017 Dodge Journey FWD 4dr SXT (JCDE49) [ Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $19,792.00 3% 90-120 NoBid | § 12600 § 596.00
Garber Ford, Inc. 17,987.00 60%
7 |2017 Ford Escape FWD 4dr S (UOF) Sarver ford, ‘nc. ¥ i
Duval Ford LLG. $17,987.00 60% 120 s 250.00 | § 25000 | § 695.00
Garber Ford, Inc. 20,513.00 % 90-120 No Bid 106.00 No Bid
8 2017 Ford Escape FWD 4dr SE (U0G) Sarver Ford, 'ne. 2 i OEY| G o Bl
Duval Ford LLC. $20,513.00 % 7084 | s 160.00 | § 160.00 | § 525.00
Ford Duval Ford LLC. 24,243.00 5% 120 252.00 250.00 695.00
or 9 2016 Ford Edge 4dr SE FWD (K3G) Duval Tord LLL, 2 i $ DIy $ >
Garber Ford, Inc. $24,243.00 5% 90-120 NoBid | § 106.00 No Bid
Duval Ford LLC. 26,898.00 5% 120 252.00 250.00 695.00
EPA Size Class: Small 10 [2017 Ford Edge 4dr SEL FWD (K3J) uvalfon $ 0/ $ L $ $ 0
Sport Utity Vehicle. 2WD Garber Ford, Inc. $26,898.00 5% 90-120 NoBid | § 106.00 No Bid
11 |2017 GMC Terrain FWD 4dr SLE w/SLE-1 (TLF26) S Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $20,884.00 0% 90-120 NoBid | § 12600 § 596.00
GMC Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck 22,346.00 0% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
12 |2017 GMC Terrain FWD 4dr SLE W/SLE-2 (TLH26) s arber Lhevrolet Fontiag Tuc 2 il OEY| G $
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMIC Cadillac $22,854.00 5% 60120 | $ 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. 17,928.00 0% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
15 |2017 Jeep Compass FWD 4dr Sport (MKTE49) arber Lhrysler Dodge Truck, nc. ¥ il OEY| O $
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $18,142.00 5% 6090 | 175.00 | 5 165.00 | § 585.00
16 |2017 Jeep Compass FWD 4dr Latitude (MKTM49) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $20,393.00 0% 90-120 NoBid | § 12600 § 596.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pi 20,243.00 5% 60-90 175.00 165.00 585.00
17 |2017 Jeep Cherokee FWD 4dr Sport (KLTL74) utoNation Smbroke Hines 2 il $ DIY $
Jeep Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $20,395.00 0% 90-120 NoBid | § 12600 § 596.00
18 |2017 Jeep Cherokee FWD 4dr Latitude (KLTM74) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $21,885.00 0% 90-120 NoBid | § 12600 § 596.00
] Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. 16,987.00 0% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
19 |2017 Jeep Patriot FWD 4dr Sport (MKTE74) arber Lhrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. ¥ il OE| G DI & >
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $17,020.00 5% 60-90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 |2017 Jeep Patriot FWD 4dr Latitude (MKTM74) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $20,182.00 0% 90-120 NoBid | § 12600 § 596.00
Nissan 21 2017 Nissan Rogue FWD 4dr S (221167) Rountree-Moore Chevrolet, Cadillac, Nissan $21,028.00 5% 120 $ 169.00 No Bid | $ 615.00
22 |2017 Toyota Highlander FWD 4dr 14 LE (SE) (6942) Rountree-Moore Toyota $25,531.00 8% 90 s 159.00 NoBid | § 535.00
Toyota 23 2017 Toyota Highlander FWD 4dr V6 LE (SE) (6946) Rountree-Moore Toyota $29,703.00 8% 90 $ 159.00 No Bid | $ 535.00
24 |2017 Toyota RAV4 FWD 4dr LE (SE) (4430) Rountree-Moore Toyota $23,303.00 8% 90 s 159.00 NoBid | § 480.00
EPA Size Class: Standard Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck 39,056.00 3% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
S 25 (2017 Chevrolet Suburban 2WD 4dr 1500 Commercial (CC15906) s e ® 2 oBIdILY u
P y ] Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $39,547.00 5% 120200 | s 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck 40,359.00 3% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
26 |2017 Chevrolet Suburban 2WD 4dr 1500 LS (CC15906) s Sarber beviolet Tontiac SUL Truck # il OEY| G $
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $40,461.00 5% 120200 | s 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck 36,421.00 5% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
27 |2017 Chevrolet Tahoe 2WD 4dr Commercial (CC15706) s Sarver bneviolat Tontiac SUL Truck $ il OEY| G $
- Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $36,905.00 5% 120200 | s 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck 37,994.00 5% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
28 |2017 Chevrolet Tahoe 2WD 4dr LS (CC15706) s Sarber bneviolat Tontiac SUL Truck $ il OEY| G $
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $38,258.00 5% 120200 | s 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck 24,029.00 5% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
29 |2017 Chevrolet Traverse FWD 4dr LS (CR14526) Sarver bneviolat Tontiac SUL Truck 2 il OEY| G $
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $24,066.00 5% 60120 | $ 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck 26,313.00 5% 90-120 No Bid 126.00 596.00
30 |2017 Chevrolet Traverse FWD 4dr LT w/ALT (CR14526) Sarver bneviolat Tontiac SUL Truck 2 il OEY| G $
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $26,525.00 5% 60120 | $ 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pi 24,194.00 15% 60-90 175.00 165.00 645.00
Dodge 31 [2017 Dodge Durango 2WD 4dr SXT (WDDL75) T S o 2 S LS s
Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $25,648.00 0% 90-120 NoBid | § 12600 § 596.00
Duval Ford LLC. 24,321.00 40% 120 250.00 250.00 695.00
32 |2017 Ford Explorer FWD 4dr Base (K7B) s Duval Tord LLL, 2 i $ DIy $ >
Garber Ford, Inc. $24,321.00 40% 90-120 NoBid | § 106.00 No Bid
Garber Ford, Inc. 26,846.00 % 120 250.00 250.00 695.00
33 |2017 Ford Explorer FWD 4dr XLT (K7D) s Sarber Ford, 'ne. 2 i $ $ $
Duval Ford LLC. $26,846.00 % 7084 | s 160.00 | § 160.00 | § 525.00
Garber Ford, Inc. 29,946.00 5% 90-120 No Bid 106.00 No Bid
34 |2017 Ford Expedition 2WD 4dr XL (U1F) o o 2 OCI| & DLl
s Duval Ford LLC. $29,946.00 5% 7084 | 160.00 | § 160.00 | § 525.00
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25100000-16-1 MOTOR VEHICLES
Attachment D.4 - Price Sheet - Light Trucks and Sport Utility Vehicles
Sub-Groups A-B: Sport Utility Vehicles
Commodity Code No. 25101507; LIGHT TRUCKS AND SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES
Updated 5/2/17
To review more information about EPA Fuel Economy please go to: https://www.fueleconomy.gov/
Please see the Info Sheet for Instructions, General Information, and reference Key.
*****NOTE: THE PRICE SHEET IS NOT COMPLETE UNLESS IT IS USED IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE COMPLETE REQUIREMENTS, SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS, AND
CONDITIONS.*****
Identified Aftermarket Options"!
q OEM q
Manufacturer/ Alternate Base Vehicle Options Estimated
Line i -time i P - - o
Sub-Group1 EPA/ Industry Class? 3 Number Representative Model* Fuel Organization Name® Price ($i#,#:4.00) Discount Lead-time in | vent/ Rain Shields, |  Vent/ Rain. Receiver / Hitch.
Brand Capable® 7 8 | Days (###)'°| Flange Mounted, ields, Tape-On, | Package, Price
(##%) Price (S# ##) (St HH#H)
T » Garber Ford, Inc. $35,059.00 1% 90-120 NoBid | § 106.00 No Bid
35 2017 Ford Expedition 2WD 4dr XLT (U1H)
Duval Ford LLC. $35,059.00 1% 70-84 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
" Garber Ford, Inc. $34,252.00 5% 90-120 No Bid | $ 106.00 No Bid
36 2017 Ford Expedition EL 2WD 4dr XL (K1F)
Duval Ford LLC. $34,252.00 5% 70-84 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
" Garber Ford, Inc. $37,448.00 1% 90-120 No Bid | $ 106.00 No Bid
37 2017 Ford Expedition EL 2WD 4dr XLT (K1H)
Duval Ford LLC. $37,448.00 1% 70-84 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
) Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $25,772.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
38 2017 GMC Acadia FWD 4dr SLE w/SLE-1 (TNB26) = —
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $26,245.00 5% 60-120 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
39 2017 GMC Acadia FWD 4dr SLE w/SLE-2 (TNC26) Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $28,387.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
GMC Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $38,445.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
40 (2017 GMC Yukon 2WD 4dr SLE (TC15706) S = =
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $38,967.00 5% 120-200 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $41,070.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
M 2017 GMC Yukon XL 2WD 4dr SLE (TC15906) = —
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $41,682.00 5% 120-200 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
Jeep 43 2017 Jeep Grand Cherokee RWD 4dr Laredo (WKTH74) S AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $25,980.00 5% 60-90 $ 175.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 645.00
Nissan 44 2017 Nissan i 2WD 4dr S (25117) Rountree-Moore Chevrolet, Cadillac, Nissan $25,442.00 4% 90 $ 169.00 No Bid | $ 585.00
I
45 2017 Nissan i 2WD 4dr V6 SV (25317) Rountree-Moore Chevrolet, Cadillac, Nissan $28,370.00 4% 90 $ 169.00 No Bid | $ 585.00
Toyota 46 2016 Toyota 4Runner RWD 4dr V6 SR5 (SE) (8642) Rountree-Moore Toyota $31,224.00 8% 90 $ 169.00 No Bid | $ 585.00
Sub-Group B: SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE. EPA Size Class: Small . Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $21,775.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
o —=nE | Svort Utiity Veicle, 4WD 47 2017 Chevrolet Equinox AWD 4dr LS (1L.626) S Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $21,863.00 5% 60120 | $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
awpT) . Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $22,927.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
Chevrolet 48 2017 Chevrolet Equinox AWD 4dr LT (1LK26) S —_————————————————
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $23,018.00 5% 60-120 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
49 2017 Chevrolet Trax AWD 4dr LS w/1LS (1JR76) Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $19,521.00 5% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
50 2017 Chevrolet Trax AWD 4dr LT (1JS76) Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $21,815.00 5% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $21,935.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
51 2017 Dodge Journey AWD 4dr SE (JCEH49) = =
Dodge AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $22,248.00 5% 60-90 $ 175.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 645.00
52 2017 Dodge Journey AWD 4dr SXT (JCEE49) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $23,007.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
Ford Duval Ford LLC. $20,658.00 6% 70-84 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
53 2017 Ford Escape 4WD 4dr SE (U9G) = =
Garber Ford, Inc. $20,658.00 6% 90-120 No Bid | $ 106.00 No Bid
Garber Ford, Inc. 25,481.00 1% 120 250.00 250.00 695.00
54 |2017 Ford Edge 4dr SE AWD (K4G) S £ o 5 3 5
Duval Ford LLC. $25,481.00 1% 56-70 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
Garber Ford, Inc. $28,172.00 1% 120 $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 695.00
55 2017 Ford Edge 4dr SEL AWD (K4J)
Duval Ford LLC. $28,172.00 1% 56-70 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
N Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $22,416.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
56 [2017 GMC Terrain AWD 4dr SLE w/SLE-1 (TLG26) S —————————
GMC Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $23,071.00 5% 60-120 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
N Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $23,969.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
57 |2017 GMC Terrain AWD 4dr SLE w/SLE-2 (TLK26) S —————————
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $24,468.00 5% 60-120 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $21,563.00 5% 60-90 $ 175.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 585.00
60 2017 Jeep Cherokee 4WD 4dr Sport (KLJL74) =
Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $22,136.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
61 2017 Jeep Cherokee 4WD 4dr Latitude (KLJM74) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $23,338.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
Jeep 62 2017 Jeep Compass 4WD 4dr Sport (MKJE49) AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $19,133.00 5% 60-90 $ 175.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 585.00
63 2017 Jeep Compass 4WD 4dr Latitude (MKJM49) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $22,116.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
64 2017 Jeep Patriot 4WD 4dr Sport (MKJE74) AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $18,317.00 5% 60-90 $ 175.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 585.00
65 2017 Jeep Patriot 4WD 4dr Latitude (MKJM74) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $21,715.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
Jeep 66 2017 Nissan Rogue AWD 4dr S (22217) Rountree-Moore Chevrolet, Cadillac, Nissan $22,264.00 5% 120 $ 169.00 No Bid | $ 585.00
Toyota 67 2017 Toyota Hi AWD 4dr V6 LE (SE) (6948) Rountree-Moore Toyota $31,378.00 8% 90 $ 159.00 No Bid | $ 535.00
Y 68 2017 Toyota RAV4 4WD 4dr LE (SE) (4432) Rountree-Moore Toyota $24,498.00 8% 90 $ 159.00 No Bid | $ 480.00
EPA Size Class: Standard @ 2017 Chevrolet Suburban 4WD 4dr 1500 Commercial (CK15906) s Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $41,851.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
ilif i VI ubul it
SportiUtility)VehicleseWn Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $42,282.00 5% 120200 | § 189.00 | § 189.00 [ § 597.00
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $43,196.00 5% 120-200 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
70 2017 Chevrolet Suburban 4WD 4dr 1500 LS (CK15906) S " "
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $43,274.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $75,011.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
ral 2017 Chevrolet Suburban 4WD 4dr 3500 LS (CK35906) = —
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $76,237.00 5% 120-200 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
N Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $39,477.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
7 2017 Fhauralat Tahas AR Ade Cammarsial (CKARTARY e N o e e R
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25100000-16-1 MOTOR VEHICLES
Attachment D.4 - Price Sheet - Light Trucks and Sport Utility Vehicles
Sub-Groups A-B: Sport Utility Vehicles
Commodity Code No. 25101507; LIGHT TRUCKS AND SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES
Updated 5/2/17
To review more information about EPA Fuel Economy please go to: https://www.fueleconomy.gov/
Please see the Info Sheet for Instructions, General Information, and reference Key.
*****NOTE: THE PRICE SHEET IS NOT COMPLETE UNLESS IT IS USED IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE COMPLETE REQUIREMENTS, SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS, AND
CONDITIONS.*****
o Identified Aftermarket Options"’
0 EM q
Manufacturer/ s Alternate _Base Vehicle Options Estm!atet!
Sub-Grnup1 EPA/ Industry (:Iass2 3 Number Representative Model‘ Fuel Organization NameS Price ($i#,#:4.00) Discount Lesditinsiin Vent/ Rain Shields, Vent/ Rain, Receiver / Hitch.
Brand Capables 7 s |Days (m)” Flange Mounted, | Shields, Tape-On. | Package, Price
(##%) Price ($#### (S# Hitt)
CreTeet N ilihiahiihatibiaahhiig Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMIC Cadillac $39,613.00 5% 120200 | s 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $40,664.00 5% 120-200 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
73 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD 4dr LS (CK15706) — —
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $40,839.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $26,003.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
74 2017 Chevrolet Traverse AWD 4dr LS (CV14526) Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $26,030.00 5% 60-120 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
Rountree-Moore Chevrolet, Cadillac, Nissan $26,145.00 4% 90 $ 169.00 No Bid No Bid
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $28,267.00 3% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
75 2017 Chevrolet Traverse AWD 4dr LT w/1LT (CV14526) Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $28,377.00 5% 60-120 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
Rountree-Moore Chevrolet, Cadillac, Nissan $28,419.00 4% 90 $ 169.00 No Bid No Bid
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $25,899.00 15% 60-90 $ 175.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 645.00
Dodge 76 2017 Dodge Durango AWD 4dr SXT (WDEL75) =
Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. $27,406.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
( Garber Ford, Inc. $26,044.00 ) 4% 90-120 No Bid | $ 106.00 No Bid
77 2017 Ford Explorer 4WD 4dr Base (K8B) S
Duval Ford LLC. $26,044.00 4% 70-84 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
Garber Ford, Inc. $28,810.00 5% 90-120 No Bid | $ 106.00 No Bid
78 2017 Ford Explorer 4WD 4dr XLT (K8D)
Duval Ford LLC. $28,810.00 5% 70-84 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
" Garber Ford, Inc. $33,281.00 15% 120 $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 695.00
79 2017 Ford Expedition 4WD 4dr XL (U1G)
Ford Duval Ford LLC. $33,281.00 15% 70-84 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
" Garber Ford, Inc. $37,638.00 1% 120 $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 695.00
80 2017 Ford Expedition 4WD 4dr XLT (U1J)
Duval Ford LLC. $37,638.00 1% 70-84 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
" Garber Ford, Inc. $36,729.00 2% 90-120 No Bid | $ 106.00 No Bid
81 2017 Ford Expedition EL 4WD 4dr XL (K1G)
Duval Ford LLC. $36,729.00 2% 70-84 $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 525.00
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Sub-Groups A-B: Sport Utility Vehicles
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To review more information about EPA Fuel Economy please go to:

https://www.fueleconomy.gov/

Please see the Info Sheet for Instructions, General Information, and reference Key.

*****NOTE: THE PRICE SHEET IS NOT COMPLETE UNLESS IT IS USED IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE COMPLETE REQUIREMENTS, SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS, AND

CONDITIONS.*****
Identified Aftermarket Options"’
q OEM g
Manufacturer/ Alternate Base Vehicle Options Estimated
Line i -time i P - - o
Sub-Grnup1 EPA/ Industry Class? 3 Number Representative Model* Fuel Organization Name® Price ($i#,#:4.00) Discount Lead-time in | vent/ Rain Shields, |  Vent/ Rain. Receiver / Hitch.
Brand Capable® 7 8 |Days (###)'°| Flange Mounted, | Shields, Tape-On. | Package, Price
(#H#%) Price Kisiii) Price HH
) Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $26,232.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
83 2017 GMC Acadia AWD 4dr SLE w/SLE-1 (TNJ26) = —
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $26,723.00 5% 60-120 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
) Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $28,677.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
84 2017 GMC Acadia AWD 4dr SLE w/SLE-2 (TNK26) —
GMC Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $29,276.00 5% 60-120 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $41,270.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
85 (2017 GMC Yukon 4WD 4dr SLE (TK15706) S _--
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $41,955.00 5% 120-200 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $43,815.00 0% 90-120 No Bid | $ 126.00 | $ 596.00
86 (2017 GMC Yukon XL 4WD 4dr SLE (TK15906) S = ————— —
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $44,417.00 5% 120-200 $ 189.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 597.00
Jeep 88 2017 Jeep Grand Cherokee 4WD 4dr Laredo (WKJH74) S AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $28,550.00 5% 60-90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nissan 89 2017 Nissan 4WD 4dr S (25017) Rountree-Moore Chevrolet, Cadillac, Nissan $27,225.00 4% 90 $ 169.00 No Bid | $ 585.00
i
920 2017 Nissan 4WD 4dr SV (25217) Rountree-Moore Chevrolet, Cadillac, Nissan $30,048.00 4% 90 $ 169.00 No Bid | $ 585.00
Toyota 91 2016 Toyota 4Runner 4WD 4dr V6 SR5 (SE) (8664) Rountree-Moore Toyota $32,932.00 8% 90 $ 169.00 No Bid | $ 585.00

KEY:

N/A - Not Available.

i (Asterisk) = Previous Representative Model. Validate Current Representative Model specified in this cell.
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