Price Quote Form (PQF}- Motor Vehicles
Contract No.: 25100000-16-1.
Updated 2/24/2016
(STATE AGENCIES NEUST ALSO SUBMIT MP6301)

\ - 5 : i}, and ne'.Nox for the sheet t
in the BL E and YELLOW shaded co!umns (auto-calcuiate} R

Street Address 3380 Highway 17 R

City,: State; Zipi.: Gireen Cove Sprlngs, FL: 32043 BRI RIRRHSHRA !
Cotitact Pérgon: Ryan Da\ns Flaet Sales

Original Quofe Date:’ 12/22/2016 | i Revised Quote Date:: Est. Delivary: 7 | 90-120 Days

S Secondary
rdav:s@garberautomali com
904-284-0054

Photie #s: 904-264-2442 [

Em:ai!-Add'resy

: |Pr@aryi

City of North Port

Ralf Heseler |

(941) 240-8531
rhesajer@cityofnerthport.com

EQUIPMENT GRCUP 100A BASE

854  Taee 2y [XUPOWER EQUIPMENT GROUP

538 bud ! |CLASS IV TRAILER HITCH RECEIVER

153 N + |FRONT LICENSE PLATE BRACKET

3
9498 ENGINE: 3.5L V& TI-VCT FFV $
4485 TRANSMISSION: ELECTRONIC 6-SPEED AUTOMATIC 3
XL8 ELECTRONIC LOCKING W/3.73 AXLE RATIO §
YZ OXFORD WHITE (Cr Standard Exterior Color) 3
AG MEDIUM EARTH GRAY, VINYL 40/20/40 FRONT SEAT $
3
$
3
3

98W  Ppoe % ¢ |SPRAY-IN BEDLINER o5 00 b
” SYNC -inc: enhanced voice recognition communication and i
52B Q,ﬁ,j{;‘* ks entertainment system (Requires 505) $ #4200 -
505 barew - JCRUISE CONTROL ST R
T&D i {TEMPORARY TAG AND DELIVERY $ nm cen O

bl Shpige  on T pes  sher
T w




- Total Discount |
Dollars:

P L A A

on-ldentified

- Option(s

4C WHELEN 4-CORNER LED STROBES 3 396.00
INSTALL 1 HOUR LABOR FOR INSTALL WITH CAB MOUNTED SWITCH $ 105.00
3K THIRD KEY AND FOB $  146.00
BB BAR AND 2" BALL FOR CLASS IV TOWING PACKAGE § 98.00
TONC BLACK ABS LOCKABLE TONNEAU COVER $ 1,198.00

falelololalalolwl]wo[o]a o]
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TOTALCOST:

Additional Savings Off Contract Price Per Vehicle* (Please provide detailed Information in Vendor Comments) $0.00

Total Vehicles Quoted (Drop Down)

Additional Savings for Example: Quantity, Dealer Special, Customer Picked Up Vehicle. Ex: DMS negotiated $50 off of contract price for XYZ
. fvehicle due to large order. -

Please confirm vehicle color. If no color is specified then the default is white.

*UNSPSC = United Nations Standard Products and Services Commodity Code
Revised 08-2015OMS |
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Attachment _u h Price mxmmﬁ Emsn ._._.:oxm and Sport c.ﬁ_ < Vshicles
Sub-Groups C-D: Trucks Under 1 Ten
Commodity Code No. 25101507; LIGHT TRUCKS OR SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES
Updated 12.2.2016
._,o _.m<_m<< Eo_.m _:wo::mn_o: mvo_._ﬁ m_u> 1_.6_ moo_._o:E u_mmmm go to:
Imm m ZG._. agﬂrmmm
e
LT o St $27,440.00 N Bl
-| 2017 Mlssan Frontler 4WD Créw Cab LWE Alto BV (33217)
5 S L SR I o S %27,580,00 % £5-180 5 130,00 | % 188.00 o Bid Mo Bld
EPA Cl: Helr3 Flcki
m._.m_M_oF aﬁ“ “Kup 117 2017 Chevrolet Sliverado 1500 WD Req Cab 118.0" Work Truck (CKA6703) 5 é% $21,845.00 % 90-120 NoBid | § 4126.00 No Bld Ko Bld
148 |2047 Chevrolet Sllverada 1500 4WD Reg Gab 119,07 LT wiiLT [CK15703) s Garber Chevinlet Pontize GHG. | g5,802.00 % 30420 NoBid | § 126.00 No Bid Mo BIG
$24,835.00 % | s0am NoBid | & 126.00 No Bl No Bid
119 2017 Chevrolet Sliverada 1500 SWD Reg Cab 133.0" Work Truck {CK15503} 5
$22B15.00 5% 50420 % 480,00 | § 488,00 Mo Bid | § 5,578.00
120 {2017 Chevrolet Sliverado 1500 4WD Reg Gab 132.0" LT wHLT [CK15803) 5 dolet! $26,283,00 % 80120 No B | § 126,00 No Bid Mo BId
Qarver chevialel Pontiac GMS. | g3,145.00 ug_ 20-120 NoBld | § 126.00 No Bld No Bid
121 2017 Chevrolet Sliverade 1500 AWD Un—_w_m Cah 143.6" Work Truck (CK16753) 5 -
. heelel $23,385,00 % 6420 | § 189,00 | § 180.00 {8 574100 No Bid
Garber Chevrolat Pontiag GMG $28,432.00 % 504120 NoBid | 5 126,00 No Bld Ho Bid
122 2017 Chevrolat Sliverado 1500 4WD Double Cab 143.5" LT wiLT {CK15752) 5
Chevrolet $28,940.00 5o E0-1z0 $ 16g.00 | § 182,00 | § 5,741,00 No Bid
$25,372.00 3% 0120 NoBid | $ 126.00 Ne Hid Ne Bid
123 {2017 Ghevrolet Sliverade 1506 4WD Crew Gab 143.5% WT (CK15543) s
$28,123.00 5% €0-120 $ 189.00 | § 164,00 No Bld Ne Bid
. §27,676.00 3% 90120 Mo Bld [ § 126,00 Ne Bid Ne Bid
124 2017 Ghevrolet Sllverado 1500 4WD Crew Cab 143.5" ET w/{LT (CK15543) 5 T
Alan Ja n_ﬁ%_mmm:ax GG $26,169,00 5% 50120 | % 183.00 | § 189.00 No Bld No Bid
E $78,744.00 % 90120 NoBld | § 126.00 ta Bld No Bld
125 [2017 Chevrolet Siverada 1500 4WD Craw Cab 153.0" W (CK15743) s 1
lan lay Cheyrolet Bulck GG $27,422.00 5% 50120 | § 188,00 | § 188,00 No Bld No Bld
Cadlllac
Sarber Cheviclet Portiac GME. | ¢y oy gg 3% 90-120 NoBid | 126,00 N B Ho Bl
125 [2017 Chevrolat Sliverado 1500 WD Crew Cab 153.0" LT witLT (CK18743) s
$20,792,00 5% 60420 % 188,00 | § 188,00 NoBld Ho Bl
Ford
Don Reld Foid $20,288.00 5% 120 ] 250.00 | $ 260,00 No Bid Ho Bkt
127 12017 Ford F-150 4WD Reg Cab 122.6° XL (F1E} 5
Garber Ford, bne, $24,330.00 % 80-120 No Bl | & 106.00 N Bld No Bid
Don Reld Eard §23,842.00 5% 120 | 262.00 | § 262.00 No Bid Na Bld
128 |20%7 Fora F-150 4WD Reg Cab 122.5" XLT {FE) s
DuvalEord LG, $24,462.00 10% sa9e | 180.00 | § 160.00 No Bid No Bld
Don Reid Ford s21,03800 .| . .8% | 420 $ 250,00 | $ 260.80 Na BId No Bid
120 |2017 Ford F-150 4WD Reg Cab 141* XL (FEE) s — :
Garber Ford, Inc, $21677.00 |0 4% | 90z Namid | § 108,60 No BId N Bl
Garber Ford, lno., $UA4.00 | 0% 90420 NoBid | $ 166,00 No Bld Na BId
130 [2017 Ford F-150 4WD Reg Gab 141" XL WiHD Paylaad Pkg (F1E) s
Duvel Ford LLC $24,270.00 % aoa |8 180.00 | § 180.00 Na Bid o Bid
: i ) ‘Dop, Reld Ford §24,048.00 % 120 § 26000 | § 26000 Na Bld Na Bld
131 12017 Ford F-{60 WD Reg Cab 141" XLT (F1E} 8
Duva! Ford LLE. $24,722.00 10% 84-98 $ 18000 | § 160.00 No Bid No Bid
122 2017 Ford F-150 4WD Reg Cab 141" XLT wfHD Payload Pkyg (FAE) 5 Daon Reld Fard $23,743.00 5% 120 $ 25000 | § 250.00 No Bld Ne Bid
.»%52& o bt Daon Re!d Ford $23,684.00 A% 120 $ 25000 | § Z50.0D Nec Bld Nc Bid
- . oy
132 2017 Ford F-150 4WD SuperCak 145" XL (X{E} -] Garber Ford, Inc. $23,476.00 90-120 NoBId | § {06.00 Na Bld Nec Bld
qw!.cﬂ!. % - . . n%&# ##guaﬂwuﬂ}aa\‘ﬁﬂﬂu&,ﬂgjﬂ:ﬁﬁc:??ﬂ?ﬂw?
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