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ALAMO GROOP (T AT 1R

[ouote [ Isale Sales Order & Quote Form Date: “8/13)2018
% Terms Code = State Contract - XF4 - FLORIDA-SHERIFF-NET 45 DAYS
8 Ship To 663208 - EVERGLADES FARM EQUIPMENT(S) FT. MYERS - 9501 ST RD 85 - FT. MYERS - FL -
S |Bill To
C&C Sales Rep Tractor Model and Year Delivery =
LmL PO# Tractor Source Tractor Type
'-D'-' Delivery State FL Front Tire Size Rear Tire Size
5 Freight Added Billing Amount =
(O [Delayed Invoice = Dealer Mounting Charges Amount =
Ecu Loading Dock = Dealer/State Commission % % Amount =
u>_1 Product Handling
Mounting |
0%
Qty of units being ordered ﬁmscount 1,2,3%
Qty ltem# Description List Cost Net Cost Total
S
2
:7_) 1 SPEC 27 2018-19 JOHN DEERE 6120 SAMAURI S 137,262.00
1 2997441 UPGRADE TO JOHN DEERE 6145/CAB/AIR/16X16PQ S 28,451.00
1 4803040 MODEL UPGRADE TO MAVERICK 30FT BOOM MOWER S 27,765.00
IN STOCK DISCOUNT S (1,714.00)
6
=
[a)
Total= $ 191,764.00

1) The acceptance of this form is not firm until credit is approved and purchase order is accepted by Alamo Industrial in Seguin Texas
2) No purchase order will be accepted for a machine with less than full standard or optional safety equipment.

3) Approximate shipping and/or delivery dates can be confirmed only by Alamo Industrial in Seguin Texas and delivery is sometimes subject to change due to

conditions beyond the control of Alamo Industrial

Note:

1) This sales order and quote form is subject to the Terms and Condition contained on page 3 of the form. If you did not receive page 3 containing the Terms

and Conditions, please contact seller so that we may send them to you.

2) This sales order and quote form expressly limits acceptance to the terms of this offer and seller hereby objects to any different or additional terms

Dealer Signature:

Date:
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ALAMO GROUF (TX) INC.
A MEMBER OF ALAMO GROU®

Information Page
PAGES ON THIS FORM MUST BE SIGNED, DATED AND SUBMITTED FOR EACH ORDER OR QUOTE

Bill To Information

Name: CITY OF NORTHPORT

Address: 1100 NCHAMBERLAIN BLVD

City: NORTHPORT State: FL Zip: 34286
Contact Name: STEVE HAUSER

Contact Number: 941-240-8540

Contact Email: SHAUSER@CITYOFNORTHPORT.COM

Ship To Information

Name: EVERGLADES FARM EQUIPMENT(S) FT. MYERS
Address: 9501 STRD 85 -
City: FT. MYERS State: FL Zip: 33905

Contact Name:

Contact Number:

Contact Email:

End-user Information

Agency:

Address:

City: State: Zip:

Contact Number:

Contact Email:

Confirmation Emails

Dealer E-Mails for Order Confirmations

Dealer E-Mails for Advance Shipment Notices (If Different than above)

Dealer E-Mails for Invoices (If Different than above)

Additional Dealer E-Mails for Invoices (If Different than above)

Dealer E-Mails for Warranty Registrations (If Different than above)
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RIAMO GROUTTIATT
A MEMRER OF ALAMO GRoUp

Request for TMOST (Tractor Mower Operator Safety Training)?

Dealer Signature: Date:

Terms & Conditions
This form must be signed unless submitting a signed PO from any Governmental Entity

ALTERATION OF TERMS AND CONDITIONS NOT PERMITTED. This Sales Order and Quote Form (“Quote”) constitutes an offer by Alamo
Industrial (“Seller”) to the buying party named on page 1 of this Quote (“Buyer”) for the sale of products set forth in the Quote. The offer made
in this Quote by Seller is subject to the terms and conditions set forth below. Buyer may accept this offer by providing Seller with an official
purchase order or other written confirmation citing the quotation number on page 1. Seller's acceptance of Buyer's order, and Seller's offer, is
expressly conditioned on Buyer's agreement to these Terms and Conditions. Seller objects to and rejects any conflicting or additional terms and
conditions proposed by Buyer in any form whatsoever. Seller expressly rejects any provisions that dictate that Buyer’s terms control or any
additional or different provisions in Buyer’s electronic business portal. Buyer's acceptance of items described in the accompanying Quote sold
hereunder will manifest Buyer's consent to these Terms and Conditions. If Buyer requests shipment based on telephone or purchase order, Buyer
does so with the understanding that these Terms and Conditions apply. No variation, addition, termination, or waiver of any term or condition will
be binding on Seller unless in writing and signed by Seller's duly authorized representative. Seller’s failure to object to any provision or terms from
Buyer will not be a waiver or amendment of any of the provisions of these Terms and Conditions.

ACCEPTANCE. ACCEPTANCE OF THIS QUOTE MEANS THAT BUYER HAS FULLY ACCEPTED AND UNDERSTANDS THE TERMS & CONDITIONS SET
FORTH IN THIS QUOTE. ANY DIFFERENT OR ADDITIONAL TERMS FROM THOSE SET FORTH IN THIS QUOTE SHALL BE VOID. This Quote
automatically expires ninety (90) calendar days from the date issued unless sooner terminated by notice.

DELIVERY. Unless otherwise agreed to in writing, delivery of equipment shall be made F.O.B. place of shipment and delivery of equipment to a
carrier at any of Seller’s plants or such other shipping points as Seller may designate shall constitute delivery to Buyer; and regardless of freight
payment, title and all risk of loss or damages in transit shall pass to Buyer at that time. Great care is taken in packing the Seller’s equipment. Seller
cannot be held responsible for breakage after having received “in good order” receipts from the transportation company. All claims for loss and
damage must be made by Buyer to the carrier. Claims for shortages or other errors must be made in writing to Seller within 30 days after receipt
of shipment, and failure to give such notice shall constitute unqualified acceptance and a waiver of all such claims by Buyer. Method and route of
shipment will be at the discretion of Seller unless Buyer shall specify otherwise, and any additional expenses of the method or route of shipment
specified by Buyer shall be borne by Buyer. Seller reserves the right to make delivery in installments, unless otherwise expressly stipulated in the
contract for sale and all such installments, when separately invoiced, shall be paid for when due per invoice without regard to subsequent
deliveries. Delay in delivery of any installment shall not relieve Buyer of its obligations to accept remaining deliveries. Seller shall not be liable for
any damage as a result of any delay due to any cause beyond the Seller’s reasonable control, including without limitation, an act of God; act of
Buyer, embargo or other governmental act, regulation or request; fire; accident; strike; slow down; war; riot; delay in transportation; or inability to
obtain necessary labor, materials or manufacturing facilities. In the event of any such delay, the date of delivery shall be extended for a period
equal to the time lost by reason of the delay.

TAXES AND OTHER CHARGES. Any manufacturer’s tax, retailer’s occupation tax, use tax, sales tax, excise tax, duty, custom, inspection or testing
fee, or other tax, fee or charge of any nature whatsoever, imposed by any governmental authority, on or measured by any transaction between
the Seller and Buyer, shall be paid by Buyer in addition to the prices quoted or invoiced. In the event Seller shall be required to pay any such tax,
fee or charge, Buyer shall reimburse Seller therefore, or, in lieu of such payment, Buyer shall provide Seller at the time the order is submitted, with
an exemption certificate of other document acceptable to the authority imposing the same.

WARRANTIES. Seller warrants for one year from the purchase date to the original non-commercial, governmental, or municipal purchaser and
warrants for six months to the original commercial or industrial purchaser that the goods purchased are free from defects in material or
workmanship. Seller will replace for Buyer any part or parts found, upon examination at one of its factories, to be defective under normal use and
service due to defects in material or workmanship. This limited warranty does not apply to any part of the goods which has been subjected to
improper or abnormal use, negligence, alteration, modification, or accident, damaged due to lack of maintenance or use of wrong fuel, oil, or
lubricants, or which has served its normal life. This limited warranty does not apply to any part of any internal combustion engine or expendable
items such as blades, shields, or guards except as specifically found in your Operator’s Manual. Except as provided herein, no employee, agent,
Dealer, or other person is authorized to give any warranties of any nature on behalf of Seller. If after examining the goods and/or parts in
question, Seller finds them to be defective under normal use and service due to defects in material or workmanship, Seller will: (a) repair or
replace the defective goods or part(s) or (b) reimburse Buyer for the cost of the part(s) and reasonable labor charges (as determined by Seller) if

Buyer paid for the repair and/or replacement prior to the final determination of applicability of the warranty by Seller. The choice of remedy shall
halano tn Sellar  Rinser ic racnnncihla far anv lahnr rharoac avraedino a reacnnahle amniint ac datarmined hv Qaller and far ratiirnino the onndc tn
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Seller, whether or not the claim is approved. Buyer is responsible for the transportation cost for the goods or part(s) to the designated factory, =~ ** e s

LIMITATION OF LIABILITY. SELLER DISCLAIMS ANY EXPRESS (EXCEPT AS SET FORTH HEREIN) AND IMPLIED WARRANTIES WITH RESPECT TO THE
GOODS INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO, MERCHANTABILITY AND FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE. SELLER MAKES NO WARRANTY AS TO
THE DESIGN, CAPABILITY, CAPACITY, OR SUITABILITY FOR USE OF THE GOODS. EXCEPT AS PROVIDED HEREIN, SELLER SHALL HAVE NO LIABILITY OR
RESPONSIBILITY TO BUYER ANY OTHER PERSON OR ENTITY WITH RESPECT TO ANY LIABILITY, LOSS, OR DAMAGE CAUSED OR ALLEGED TO BE
CAUSED DIRECTLY OR INDIRECTLY BY THE GOODS INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO, ANY INDIRECT, SPECIAL, CONSEQUENTIAL, OR INCIDENTAL
DAMAGES RESULTING FROM THE USE OR OPERATION OF THE GOODS OR ANY BREACH OF THIS WARRANTY. NOT WITHSTANDING THE ABOVE
LIMITATIONS AND WARRANTIES, SELLER’S LIABILITY HEREUNDER FOR DAMAGES INCURRED BY BUYER OR OTHERS SHALL NOT EXCEED THE PRICE
OF THE GOODS. NO ACTION ARISING OUT OF ANY CLAIMED BREACH OF THIS WARRANTY OR TRANSACTIONS UNDER THIS WARRANTY MAY BE
BROUGHT MORE THAN TWO (2) YEARS AFTER THE CAUSE OF ACTION HAS OCCURRED.

ASSIGNMENT. Neither party may assign or transfer this Quote or any interest therein without the written consent of the other party, except that
Seller may assign this Quote and its interest therein to any affiliated corporation, or to any corporation succeeding to Seller’s business without the
consent of Buyer.

LAW. This Quote shall be construed according to the laws of the State of Texas, exclusive of conflicts of laws principles. Venue shall be in

Guadalupe County, Texas.

Dealer Signature: Date:




Eagle
Exten A Kut

Falcon

Grass King
Interstater
Machete 2
Manual Form
Maverick 2
Rear Mount
Ridge Runner
Samurai 1.8
SHD
Switchblade
Traxx

Versa Boom
Versa Mower

KB1800-2200

RH Terrain Master
DW Terrain Master
KB21

ALAMO GROUP (TX) INC.™
A MEMBER OF ALAMO GROUP
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All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership . Type of Vehicle Zone Base Un.lt
Price

AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR WITH BOOM MOWER (4 WHEEL DRIVE) (Specification #27
2019 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Western NB -
Boom Mower
2019 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Western ~NB --
Boom Mower
2019 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Waihes NB -
Boom Mower
2019 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Northern NB -
Boom Mower
2019 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Central —NB -
Boom Mower
2019 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Caiitea] - NB -
Boom Mower
2019 Case ITH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Southern _NB -
Boom Mower
2019 Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Soutieri - NB -
Boom Mower

Ring Power Corporation 2019 Challenges MI463 with Diamond Western $145,917.00
Boom Mower
2019 Challenger MT465 with Diamond Western ~NB -
Boom Mower

Ring Power Corporation 2019 Chillenger MI465 with Diamand Northern $145,917.00
Boom Mower
2019 Challenger MT465 with Diamond T NB .
Boom Mower

Ring Power Corporation 2019 Challenger MT465 with Diamond Central $145,917.00
Boom Mower
2019 Challenger MT465 with Diamond Central NB -
Boom Mower

Kelly Tractor Co 2015 Ul g METAG pith. Digmoud Southern $140,128.00
Boom Mower
2019 Challenger MT465 with Diamond Southern NB -

Boom Mower



Alamo Industrial

Alamo Industrial

Alamo Industrial

Alamo Industrial

Dobbs Equipment LL.C

Dobbs Equipment LL.C

Dobbs Equipment LLC

Dobbs Equipment LLC

Terrain King

Terrain King

Terrain King

Terrain King

2019 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower
2019 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial
Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower

2019 John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal
Boom Mower

2019 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower

2019 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower

2019 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower

2019 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower

2019 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower

2019 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower

2019 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower

Western

Western

Northern

Northern

Central

Central

Southern

Southern

Western

Western

Northern

Northern

Central

Central

Southern

Southern

* Western

Western

*Northern

Northern

* Central

Central

* Southern

$137,262.00

- NB --

$137,262.00

$137,262.00

—-NB --

$137,900.00
—-NB --
$137,900.00
—-NB --
$137,900.00
—-NB --
$137,900.00

—-NB --

$128,844.00
--NB --
$128,844.00
= NB ==
$128,844.00
--NB --

$128,844.00



Kelly Tractor Co

Kelly Tractor Co

Alamo Industrial

Alamo Industrial

Alamo Industrial

Alamo Industrial

2019 Kubota M6S-111 with Terrain King
KB2300 Boom Mower

2019 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower

2019 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower

2019 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower

2019 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower

2019 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower

2019 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower

2019 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower

2019 Massey Ferguson MF5712SL with
Diamond Boom Mower

2019 New Holland TS6.120 with Alamo
Boom

2019 New Holland TS6.120 with Alamo
Boom

2019 New Holland TS6.120 with Alamo
Boom

2019 New Holland TS6.120 with Alamo
Boom

2019 New Holland TS6.120 with Alamo
Boom
2019 New Holland TS6.120 with Alamo
Boom
2019 New Holland TS6.120 with Alamo
Boom

2019 New Holland T'S6.120 with Alamo
Boom

Southern

Western

Western

Northern

Northern

Central

Central

Southern

Southern

Western

Western

Northern

Northern

Central

Central

Southern

Southern

--NB --

~-NB --

-~ NB -

- NB --

~NB --

$132,384.00

--NB --

$132,384.00

- NB --

$135,542.00

--NB --

$135,542.00

--NB --

$135,542.00

—NB -

$135,542.00

- NB -
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR WITH BOOM MOWER (4 WHEEL DRIVE)
SPECIFICATION #27

2019 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial Mower

The John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial Mower purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified
by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this

contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone. P o S
ZONE: Western Northern / i{/ Central k Southern
BASE PRICE: $137,262.00 $137,262.00 = ’\‘ $137,262.00 $137,262.00

N\ »
While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have\ﬁttempted to-identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code
04851805 !

02997278 !

02995550 !
02997803 !

02986203 !

Order Code
04852208 !

02995549 !
04862201 !
04802440 !
04802840 !
02997441 !

04803040 !

02995549 !

6120M Alamo Industrial Mower

Alamo Industrial Alamo Industrial Alamo Industrial

Western Northern Central

$137,262.00 $137,262.00 $137,262.00
Delete Options

' Downgrade model - specify
18’ Boom with Cable/Lever Control 1

| Downgrade model - specify
JD5100M C/4 (in-lieu-of JD6120M R/4) - 18' Boom Only 1

| Downgrade to 2 wheel drive
Downgrade to a 20' boom reach

Downgrade - specify
JD610SE Cab/4wd (in-lieu-of JD6120M R/4) - 18-22' Boom Only 1

| Downgrade - specify
| JD5090M Cab/4wd (in-lieu-of JD6120M R/4) - 18' Boom Only 1

“ Optional equipment delete - specif?r
Remove 60" Rotary Cutter w/Head Swivel

l Optional equipment delete - specify
| Optional equipment delete - specify

Add Options

| Model upgrade - specify
| Joystick (in-lieu-of Cable/Lever Controls) - Samurai Only 1

' Model upgrade - specify
JD6110M Cab/4wd RIW Radials (in-lieu-of JD6120M ROPS/4wd) 1

| Model upgrade - specify
| 22' Machete2 Boom (in-lieu-of 23' Samurai Cable/Lever) 1

| Model upgrade - specify
24" Maverick2 Telescoping Boom (in-lieu-of 23' Samurai Lever) 1

| Model upgrade - specify
| 28' Maverick2 Fixed Length Boom (in-lieu-of 23' Samurai Lever) 1

Model upgrade - specify
JDG6145M C/4 R1W Radials (in-lieu-of JD6120M R/4) - Req'd for 30" |

Model upgrade - specify
[ 30' Maverick2 Telescoping Boom (in-lieu-of 23' Samurai Lever) 1

j Enclosed cab with heating and air conditioning
‘ Air suspension seat cab only

| AM/FM stereo

‘ Rear washer/wiper, rotating beacon

| 4-wheel drive

; Oscillating hydraulic assist front axle

| CVT transmission with constant velocity

' 3 spool valve and selector

Alamo Industrial
Southern
$137,262.00

All Zones
$1,269.00"

| $8,928.00'|

NA
ﬁ NA |
1$12,206.00"

1$13,455.00" |
'$13,168.00"

NA |
NA |

:All Zones
| $7,486.00"|

|

| $9.633.00"]

| $8,691.00" |
1 $20,435.00" |

1$26,298.00' |

$28,451.00')/

1$27,765.00' )

1$14,383.00"

{ Incl. {
Incl. |
Incl. ;
Incl.
NA |
NA |
NA |



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

02995551

04852505 !

0298619087 !
0298621387 !
0298621287 !
029862517 !
02986253 !

02988881 !

02988233 !
02992647 !
02997804 !
02986235 !
02986229 !
02988854 !
02989326 !

02989327 !

02975647 !

6120M Alamo Industrial Mower

Alamo Industrial Alamo Industrial Alamo Industrial

Western Northern Central
$137,262.00 $137,262.00 $137,262.00
' Additional fuel tank

Telescopic mirrors

Treleborg 22 ply tires or equivalent
(Upgrade for JD 6M Models Only) 1

High capacity air cleaner

25' boom mower with 1'otarY 5' cutting head
(For Samurai & Machete2 Only)

25' boom mower with rotary 5' flail cutting head
Additional required wheel weights for boom mower
Headmount, 15 degree offset

Electronic: 3 point hitch control

Optional equipment - specify
60" Rotary w/Center Hyd Door, Blade Bar & Head Swivel 1

Optional equipment - specify
50" Rotary w/Center Hyd Door, Blade Bar & Head Swivel L

Optional equipment - specify
50" Rotary w/Center Hyd Door, Blade Pan & Head Swivel 1

Optional equipment - specify
48" Flail Axe Heavy Duty Flail w/Center Hyd Door & Head Swivel 1

Optional equipment - specify
48" Flail Axe Heavy Duty Flail w/Center Hyd Door (No Head Swivel) 1

Optional equipment - specify
60" Grass Flail w/Head Swivel 1

Optional equipment - specifY
60" Grass Flail (No Head Swivel)

Optional equipment - specify
52" Battle Axe Extreme Duty Grass & Brush Flail 1

Optional equipment - specify
50" SRD Severe Duty Forestry Cutting Head (No Head Swivel) 1

Optional equipment - specify
90" BuzzBar Saw Head - 4 Blade (No Head Swivel) 1

Optional equipment ~ specify
69" Buzzbar Saw Head - 3 Blade (No Head Swivel) 1

Optional equipment - specify
Ditcher Head (Diteh Clean-Out Only) 1

Optional equipment - specify
Quick Hitch Kit (Converts Boom & One Cuiting Head) 1

Optional equipment - specify
Quick Hitch Aux. Kit (One Req'd for Each Additional Head) 1

Optional equipment - specify
48" Flail Parking Stand Kit (Req'd for Quick Hitch Application) 1

Alamo Industrial

Southern
$137,262.00

NA
Incl.
$4,265.00"

NA
$2.243.00"

NA
NA
NA
NA
$14,831.00"

$14,126.00"
$13,295.00"
$14,680.00"
$13,014.00"
$14,968.00"
$13,144.00"
$16,637.00" |
$18,479.00"
$16,220.00"
$14,397.00"
$13,381.00
$3,986.00"
$528.00"

$335.001




VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

02984400 !
02990399 !

CATDISCOUNT !

6120M Alamo Industrial Mower

Alamo Industrial Alamo Industrial Alamo Industrial
Westernn Northern Central
$137,262.00 $137,262.00 $137,262.00

Optional equipment - specify
60" Grass Flail Parking Stand (Req'd for Quick Hitch Application) 1

Optional equipment - specify
Ditcher Parking Stand (Req'd for Quick Hitch Application) |

Optional equipment - specify
Discount From Current Catalog - 12% 1

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
Temporary tag

Maintenance Plan ~ specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Extended warranty — 3rd & 4th years

Extended warranty — 3rd year

Alamo Industrial
Southern
$137,262.00

$344.00"
$660.00"
$12.00!

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA




FLORIDA
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR WITH BOOM MOWER (4 WHEEL DRIVE)
SPECIFICATION #27

2019 John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial Mower
(Alternate Dealer Option)

The John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial Mower purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified
by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program: Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determme the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE: 6120M Alamo Industrial Mower (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern
BASE PRICE: - No bid -- -- No bid --

Order Code Delete Options
Downgrade model - specify

Downgrade model - specify
Downgrade to 2 wheel drive
Downgrade to a 20' boom reach
Downgrade - specify

Downgrade - specify

Optional equipment delete - specify
Optional equipment delete - specify
Optional equipment delete - specify

Order Code Add Options
Model upgrade - specify

Model upgrade - specify

Model upgrade - specify

Model upgrade - specify

Model upgrade - specify

Model upgrade - specify

Model upgrade - specify

Enclosed cab with heating and air conditioning
Alr suspension seat cab only

AM/EM stereo

Rear washer/wiper, rotating beacon

4-wheel drive

Oscillating hydraulic assist front axle

CVT transmission with constant velocity

3 spool valve and selector

Additional fuel tank

Telescopic mirrors

Treleborg 22 ply tires or equivalent

High capacity air cleaner

25" boom mower with rotary 5! cutting head
25' boom mower with rotary 5' flail cutting head
Additional required wheel weights for boom mower

Headmount, 15 degree offset

Electronic 3 point hitch control

Central Southern
-- No bid -- --No bid --

All Zones

All Zones




VEHICLE:

6120M Alamo Industrial Mower (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western
BASE PRICE: - No bid --

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

Temporary tag
Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Northern
-- No bid --

Extended warranty —3rd & 4th years

Extended warranty — 3rd year

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
--No bid --
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