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3 Adenocard (Adenosine) 12mg, 3mg/ml, 4ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $27.10 BTM #0301-68 $31.71 No Bid $136.78 -

4 Adenocard (Adenosine) 6mg, 3mg/ml, 2ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $4.11 BTM #0542-02 $19.71 No Bid $72.11 -

5 Airway, endotracheal, 2.5mm, uncuffed Rusch 150025 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-2385-S $3.45 TEL150025 $3.59 $33.80 10/Box $3.4700 $0.54 KENTRON #739925 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23325         

6 Airway, endotracheal, 3.0mm, uncuffed Rusch 150030 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-2386-S $1.35 Smiths POR100/103/030 $3.59 $3.38 $3.4700 $0.54 KENTRON #739930 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23330         

7 Airway, endotracheal, 3.5mm, uncuffed Rusch 150035 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-2387-S $1.35 Smiths POR100/103/035 $3.59 $3.38 $3.4700 $0.54 KENTRON #739935 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23335         

8 Airway, endotracheal, 4.0mm, uncuffed Rusch 150040 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-2388-S $1.35 Smiths POR100/103/040 $3.59 $3.38 $3.4700 $0.54 KENTRON #739940 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23340         

9 Airway, endotracheal, 4.5mm, uncuffed Rusch 150045 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-2389-S $1.35 Smiths POR100/103/045 $3.59 $3.38 $3.4700 $0.54 KENTRON #739945 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23345         

10 Airway, endotracheal, 5.0mm, uncuffed Rusch 150050 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-2390-S $1.35 Smiths POR100/103/050 $3.59 $3.38 $3.4700 $0.54 KENTRON #739950 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23350         

11 Airway, endotracheal, 5.5mm, cuffed Rusch 170055 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-239010-S $1.38 Smiths POR100/102/055 $3.99 $3.39 Rusch; Flexi-Set $3.7700 $0.63 KENTRON #749955 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23455         

12 Airway, endotracheal, 6.0mm, cuffed Rusch 170060 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-2392-S $1.38 Smiths POR100/102/060 $4.44 $3.39 Rusch; Flexi-Set $3.7700 $0.63 KENTRON #749960 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23460         

13 Airway, endotracheal, 7.0mm, cuffed Rusch 170070 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-2394-S $1.38 Smiths POR100/102/070 $3.99 $3.39 Rusch; Flexi-Set $3.7700 $0.63 KENTRON #749970 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23470         

14 Airway, endotracheal, 8.0mm, cuffed Rusch 170080 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-2396-S $1.38 Smiths POR100/102/080 $3.99 $3.39 Rusch; Flexi-Set $3.7700 $0.63 KENTRON #749980 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23480         

15 Airway, endotracheal, 9.0mm, cuffed Rusch 170090 Ea 3.2700$                                 EAW-2398-S $1.38 Smiths POR100/102/090 $3.99 $3.39 Rusch; Flexi-Set $3.7700 $0.63 KENTRON #749990 $1.65 Medsource, MS-23490         

16 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 12fr Rusch 123312 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2412-S $2.11 TEL123312 $2.30 $2.05 $2.1200 $1.09 KENTRON #804412 $2.62 -

17 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 14fr Rusch 123314 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2414-S $2.11 TEL123314 $2.30 $2.05 $2.1200 $1.09 KENTRON #804414 $2.62 -

18 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 16fr Rusch 123316 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2416-S $2.11 TEL123316 $2.30 $2.05 $2.1200 $1.09 KENTRON #804416 $2.62 -

19 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 18fr Rusch 123318 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2418-S $2.11 TEL123318 $2.30 $2.05 $2.1200 $1.09 KENTRON #804418 $2.62 -

20 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 20fr Rusch 123320 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2420-S $1.66 Dynarex DYN4591 $2.30 $2.05 $2.0600 $1.09 KENTRON #804420 $2.36 -

21 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 22fr Rusch 123322 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2422-S $1.66 Dynarex DYN4592 $2.30 $2.05 $2.0600 $1.09 KENTRON #804422 $2.36 -

22 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 24fr Rusch 123324 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2424-S $1.66 Dynarex DYN4593 $2.30 $2.05 $2.0600 $1.09 KENTRON #804424 $2.36 -

23 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 26fr Rusch 123326 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2426-S $1.66 Dynarex DYN4594 $2.30 $2.05 $2.0600 $1.09 KENTRON #804426 $2.36 -

24 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 28fr Rusch 123328 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2428-S $1.66 Dynarex DYN4595 $2.30 $2.05 $2.0600 $1.09 KENTRON #804428 $2.36 -

25 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 30fr Rusch 123330 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2430-S $1.66 Dynarex DYN4596 $2.30 $2.05 $2.0600 $1.09 KENTRON #804430 $2.36 -

26 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 32fr Rusch 123332 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2432-S $1.66 Dynarex DYN4597 $2.30 $2.05 $2.0600 $1.09 KENTRON #804432 $2.36 -

27 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 34fr Rusch 123334 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2434-S $1.66 Dynarex DYN4598 $2.30 $2.05 $2.0600 $1.09 KENTRON #804434 $2.36 -

28 Airway, nasopharyngeal, 36fr Rusch 123336 Ea 2.3700$                                 EAW-2436-S $1.66 Dynarex DYN4599 $2.30 $2.05 $2.0600 $1.09 KENTRON #804436 $2.36 -

29 Airway, oropharyngeal, Berman-style, 40mm Ea 0.1600$                                 EAW-240001 $0.16 TEL121801 $0.13 BTM #13050 $0.25 $0.1600 $0.095 KENTRON #779940 $0.15 -

30 Airway, oropharyngeal, Berman-style, 50mm Ea 0.1600$                                 
EAW-240101 $0.16 TEL121850 $0.13 BTM #12970MS $0.25 $0.1600 $0.095 KENTRON #779950 $0.16 -

31 Airway, oropharyngeal, Berman-style, 60mm Ea 0.1600$                                 EAW-240201 $0.16 TEL121802 $0.13 BTM #13052 $0.25 $0.1600 $0.095 KENTRON #779960 $0.15 -

32 Airway, oropharyngeal, Berman-style, 70mm Ea 0.1600$                                 EAW-240801 $0.16 TEL121870 $0.13 BTM #12971MS $0.25 $0.1600 $0.095 KENTRON #779970 $0.15 -

33 Airway, oropharyngeal, Berman-style, 80mm Ea 0.1624$                                 EAW-240301 $0.16 TEL121803 $0.13 BTM #13053 $0.25 $0.1600 $0.095 KENTRON #779980 $0.15 -

34 Airway, oropharyngeal, Berman-style, 90mm Ea 0.1624$                                 EAW-240401 $0.16 TEL121804 $0.13 BTM #13054 $0.25 $0.1600 $0.095 KENTRON #779990 $0.15 -

35 Airway, oropharyngeal, Berman-style, 100mm Ea 0.1600$                                 EAW-240501 $0.16 TEL121805 $0.13 BTM #13055 $0.25 $0.1600 $0.095 KENTRON #779100 $0.15 -

36 Airway, oropharyngeal, Berman-style, 110mm Ea 0.1600$                                 EAW-241001 $0.16 TEL121806 $0.13 BTM #13056 $0.25 $0.1600 $0.095 KENTRON #779110 $0.15 -

37 Airway, oropharyngeal, Berman-style, 6-sizes Ea 1.8400$                                 EAW-24110399 $1.51 SUN1-1508-00 $0.64 BTM #13049 $2.40 $1.7500 SEEquip made kit with SunMed items $0.89 KENTRON #166669 $2.16 -

38 Airway, supraglottic, size 1 Intersurgical 8201000 Ea 16.7000$                               EAW-232620 $13.99 ISI8201000 $14.25 $13.7100 $6.99 KENTRON #719901, LARYNGEAL MASK $24.28 -

39 Airway, supraglottic, size 1.5 Intersurgical 8215000 Ea 16.7000$                               
EAW-232621 $13.99 ISI8215000 $14.25 $13.7100 $6.99 KENTRON #719915, LARYNGEAL MASK $24.28 -

40 Airway, supraglottic, size 2 Intersurgical 8202000 Ea 16.7000$                               
EAW-232622 $13.99 ISI8202000 $14.25 $13.7100 $6.99 KENTRON #719902, LARYNGEAL MASK $24.28 -

41 Airway, supraglottic, size 3, Resus Pack Intersurgical 8703000 Ea 16.7000$                               
EAW-232624 $23.30 ISI8703030 $24.27 BTM #2114-87301 $13.7100

$39.06 -

42 Airway, supraglottic, size 4, Resus Pack Intersurgical 8704000 Ea 16.7000$                               
EAW-232625 $23.30 ISI8704030 $24.27 BTM #2114-87302 $13.7100

$39.06 -

43 Airway, supraglottic, size 5, Resus Pack Intersurgical 8705000 Ea 16.7000$                               
EAW-232626 $23.30 ISI8705030 $24.27 BTM #2114-87303 $13.7100

$39.06 -

44 Albuterol Sulfate 0.083% 2.5mg, 3ml, Individually 
Wrapped

Nephron Pharmaceuticals 0487-9501-01 Box/30 -$                                   #N/A No Bid $5.49 $3.30 No Bid $12.00 -

45 Amiodarone 150mg, 50mg/ml, 3ml Vial vial -$                                   #N/A No Bid $2.14 BTM #0616-03 $1.74 No Bid $6.97 -

46 Ammonia inhalant Dynarex 1401 Box/10 1.6500$                                 EFA-4010 $1.86 DYN1401 $2.17 $2.00 Sub; James Alexander $1.9200 $1.89 $1.73 Pacc-Kit, 9-001          

47 Asherman Chest Seal Rusch 849100 Ea 10.0200$                               EFA-1067 $8.11 TEL849100 $9.76 $8.47 $8.1600 $9.80 $8.88 -

48 Aspirator, meconium, newborn, w/ thumb port Neotech N0101 Ea 3.3000$                                 
EAW-2225 $4.21 NEON0101 $4.33 $3.86 $4.0000 $5.25 $3.70 -

49 Aspirin, Chewable, 81mg, 36 count Bottle/36 0.9900$                                 EFA-4612 $0.60 GER911-36 $0.75 BTM #911316 $0.66 No Bid $0.99 LEADER PHARMA $0.66 -

50 Atropine Sulfate 1mg, 0.01mg/ml, 10ml Hospira 0409491134 Ea -$                                   #N/A No Bid $11.34 $10.72 No Bid $17.59 -

51 Backboard, pediatric immobilizer, 48", w/case Allied Healthcare Products L484-040C Ea 359.6300$                             EBB-190001 $349.46 ALLL484-040C $294.00 $294.26 $216.9500 $139.00 KENTRON #881320 $239.90 -

52 Backboard, plastic, w/pins Ferno-Washington 18" Millennia Blue Ea no bid $290.33 FER0107916 $203.96 BTM #5392BL $351.7200 $89.00 KENTRON #883365B $236.25 -

53 Bag, Airway, 27" x 12" x 10", Red, UP Iron Duck 34016DUP Ea $188.43 IRO34016D-RDUP $199.93 $208.00 $287.3600 $189.00 KENTRON $202.41 -

54 Bag, Airway, BLS, Blue Ferno-Washington MB5100 Ea $282.00 FER0819770 $211.75 BTM #2521-00105 $296.00 $264.0000 $169.00 KENTRON $220.81 -

55 Bag, infectious waste, red, 1.25 mil, 16gal TIDI Products 8654 Ea -$                                   no bid $0.13 
Medegen 25x34, ACT108M, sold 250/cs 
$31.25

$0.10 BTM #520-RD650 $7.92 Sub; Medgen 100/bx No Bid $0.15 KENTRON #098013 $0.17 All American Poly, 1008878

56 Bag, Trauma, 17" x 9" x 7", Orange, UP Iron Duck 36001S Ea $74.10 IRO36001S-OR $33.80 $66.1600
*UP* is not available in orange.  Available 
standard bag only $39.00 KENTRON #436001 $60.62 -

57 Bandage, Ace, 4" x 5 1/2yds Dynarex 3664 Ea 3.8900$                                 EFA-1072 $0.50 DYN3664 $0.58 $0.30 $0.5300 $0.39 KENTRON #670724 $0.50 Medline, MDS055004        

58 Bandage, adhesive (Band-aid), 3/4"x 3" Dynarex 3611 Ea 1.3000$                                 EFA-1103 $0.01 
ASO, sold 100/bx $1.25  ASOCBD4018-012-
000

$0.02 $0.83 $0.0148 *Sold by box of 100 only ($1.48/box) $0.0090 KENTRON #880075 $0.02 A.R. Medicom Inc., 1126132

59 Bandage, stretch (kling), non-sterile, 4" x 4' Dynarex 3104 Ea 1.3100$                                 EFA-1002 $0.12 DYN3104, sold 12/bg $1.38 $0.12 $0.86 Sub; Moore Brand 12/bx $0.1200 *Sold by box of 12 only ($1.44/box) $0.11000 KENTRON #440004 $0.07 Henry Schein, 1042728

60 Bandage, triangular, 40" x 40" x 56" Dynarex 3680 Ea 3.9900$                                 EFA-1090 $0.35 DYN3680, sold 12/bx $4.20 $0.23 BTM #1124-03680 $0.39 Sub; Moore brand $0.3100 $0.24 KENTRON #404056 $0.27 ADI Medical, 23040

61 Bariatric Transfer Sheet R&B Fabrications 181YL Ea $173.87 R/B181YL $37.99 BTM #3244-40802 $164.3400 $189.00 DICK MEDICAL SUPPLY #30060OR $183.80 -

62 Battery, Laerdal Suction Unit Laerdal 780800 Ea 134.5200$                             EAW-226810 $99.54 LAE780800 $101.43 $743.00 $96.2600 $49.00 OSI #OL2.3-12 $88.90 -

63 Battery, LP-15 Physio-Control 21330-001176 Ea 389.4100$                             EDI-706010 $412.36 PHC21330-001176 $387.94 $381.74 $414.7900 $489.00 $387.95 -

64 Battery, LP-500 Physio-Control 11141-000147 Ea 169.4300$                             EDI-7082 No Bid $299.00 BTM #323005380026 $277.56 $294.1900 $369.00 11141-000158--NEW NUMBER $185.29 -

65 Bed Pan Medline Industries DYNC8522 Ea 1.0300$                                 EFA-4513 $0.73 Medegen ACTH100-10 $1.02 BTM #536-DYNC8521 $0.95 $0.7700 $1.05 KENTRON #410010 $0.94 -

66 Belt, Quick Release Gait Posey 6528-QL Ea 11.8500$                               6528-QL $9.49 POS6528QL $9.76 $23.00 Sub; Moore Brand $11.4900 $7.79 KENTRON # $9.42 -

67 Bite stick ADC 4010 Ea 0.4400$                                 EAW-2790 $0.29 AME4010T $0.36 $0.22 $0.3400 $0.27 KENTRON #404075 $0.36 Graham-Field, 3789

68 Blanket, emergency, disposible, 60" x 90", yellow Roehampton 690 Ea $0.99 Graham, GRA54849 $4.42 $3.63 Sub; Tech Med $2.7900 Allcare EB100: Trauma Blanket Yellow 60x90 $1.19 KENTRON #886657 $3.54 Medsource, MS-B200         

69 Blanket, emergency, space, survival, 52" x 84" Dynarex 3537 Ea 0.5600$                                 
EFA-1170 $0.43 Dukal DUK721 $0.42 $0.42 Sub; Moore Brand $0.4000 $0.42 KENTRON #886656 $0.42 Dukal Corporation, 721

70 Blood glucose monitor Bayer Contour 9545C Ea 9.2500$                                 EFA-400300 $0.00 
BAY06707040-EMS, No Charge w/award of 
strips

$18.98 $0.00 $0.0000 Free with every 2 bottles of strips $8.95 BAYER $15.84 -

71 Blood glucose, lancet, 1.8mm, 21g Hypoguard 970121 Ea 0.0850$                                 EDI-327700-BL $0.07 HYP980121, sold 100/bx $6.80 $0.07 $8.89 100/box $20.0100 $0.095 DYNAREX $0.10 -

72 Blood glucose, test strips Bayer 7099C Ea 15.9200$                               EFA-400310 $0.29 BAY06707245, sold 50/bx $14.50 $0.32 $14.50 50/box $14.8600 $14.19 BAYER 7097C EQUAL TO 7099C $0.28 -

73 BP cuff, nylon, adult ADC 760-11ABK Ea 19.8900$                               EDI-734200-BL $16.23 AME760-11ABK $17.88 $16.15 $18.1000 $4.69 KENTRON #777701 $14.93 -
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74 BP cuff, nylon, child ADC 760-9CBK Ea 24.8500$                               EDI-734203 $16.23 AME760-9CBK $17.88 $13.80 $18.1000 $4.69 KENTRON 3777703 $14.93 -

75 BP cuff, nylon, infant ADC 760-8IBK Ea 24.8500$                               EDI-734204 $16.23 AME760-7IBK $15.97 BTM #540019 $18.58 $18.0000 $4.69 KENTRON #777704 $14.93 -

76 BP cuff, nylon, thigh ADC 760-13TBK Ea 33.6000$                               EDI-734206 $22.24 AME760-13TBK $24.79 $23.86 $24.7900 $5.39 KENTRON #777705 $20.46 -

77 Broselow Pediatric ALS Organizer Broselow AE-4805 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $247.9500
Medical Emergency Device Innovations: PQR10017 - 
Pedisleeve ALS with color coded pouches $139.00 KENTRON ORGANIZER # no bid -

78 Broselow Pediatric Emergency Tape, 2017 version Broselow AE-4800 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $8.7700 PTR3001 - Peditape for Pedisleeve $18.29 PEDIA TAPE no bid -

79 Bulb syringe, sterile, 2oz, latex free Amsino AS502S Ea 0.7400$                                 EFA-5401 $0.69 AMSAS00502S $0.55 $0.82 $0.6400 $0.39 KENTRON #350200 $0.72 -

80 Burn sheet, 60" x 96" GAM Industries 30-01 Ea $1.64 MedSource MSOMS-BS0033 $1.92 BTM #30061MS $1.90 Sub; Medtech $2.3900 Dynarex 3520 sterile burn sheet 60x96 $1.59 KENTRON #888111 $1.65 AllCare, BS100          

81 Capnography, FilterLine Set EtCO2 Airway Adapter Covidien 007768 Ea 9.0400$                                 EDI-7120 $10.38 PHC11996-000081 $8.44 $9.4200
Philips Healthcare M1920A: Filter Line Set 
AD/Pedi

$8.44 -

82 Capnography, Smart CapnoLine Nasal Cannula, 
Pediatric

Covidien 007269 Ea 14.1000$                               EDI-7127-s $15.75 PHC11996-000128, sold 25/bx $393.75 $11.15 $13.5500
Philips Healthcare M2524A: Smart Capnoline 
Pedi Single Use

$12.82 -

83 Capnography, Smart CapnoLine Plus Nasal Cannula, 
Adult

Covidien 010210 Ea 9.8700$                                 EDI-7126-s $11.44 PHC11996-000167 $8.88 $13.5500
Philips Healthcare M2526A: Smart Capnoline 
Ad Single Use

$15.26 -

84 Case, BLS, Pelican EMS, Medium, Orange Pelican 1550EMS Ea 143.2500$                             ECC-1550-OR $249.90 PPI1550EMS $249.80 $348.85 $290.9600 $469.00 $287.47 -

85 Case, BLS, Pelican EMS, Large, Black Pelican 1600EMS Ea 141.7400$                             ECC-160001-BK $305.00 PPI1600EMS $298.95 $411.80 $344.8000 $259.00 PELICAN 1500 EMS BLACK $340.64 -

86 Case, glove, 4" x 3" black EMI 602 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $0.10 $1.95 Sub; Medtech $5.0900
R&B Fabrication 2438K: Glove case small nylon 
black 4"x3" $2.69 KENTRON # $2.12 -

87 Cold pack, regular, 6" x 9" Dynarex 4512 Ea 9.5900$                                 EFA-4200 $0.39 DYN4512, sold 24/cs $9.36 $0.28 BTM #11405 $0.44 $0.3700
MABIS 612-0010-9824 Cold Pack 6x8 (24/case) *Sold 
by case of 24 only ($8.88/case) $0.49 KENTRON #561111 $0.34 DMS Holdings, 6120010-9824       

88 Collar, adjustable, adult Ambu 000281000 Ea 5.0200$                                 ECO-3801 $5.26 AMB000-281-000 $4.08 $5.22 $5.1000 $5.49 AMBU $4.92 -

89 Collar, adjustable, infant/pediatric Ambu 000281106 Ea 5.5600$                                 ECO-3803 $5.26 AMB000-281-106 $4.08 $5.22 $5.1000 $5.49 AMBU $4.92 -

90 CPAP adapter for nebulizer, 22mm x 30mm Pulmodyne 313-2230 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $1.97 $2.70 No Bid no bid -

91 CPAP System, Large Adult, c/w mask (size 5) O_Two 01CV0211-cs Ea 31.4800$                               EAW-296817 $55.54 OTM01CV0211-CS $40.59 $31.15 $36.0400
$28.53 -

92 CPAP System, Small Adult, c/w face mask (size 4) O_Two 01CV0212-cs Ea 31.4800$                               EAW-296816 $55.54 OTM01CV0212-CS $42.00 $31.15 $36.0400
$28.53 -

93 CPR Mask w/case Ambu 000252123 Ea 14.1200$                               EAW-2758 $10.20 AMB000-252-123 $12.00 $10.77 $3.4300
Kemp USA: 10-501 CPR Mask with one way 
valve, o2 inlet & hard case $2.99 KENTRON #809910 $10.18 -

94 Cyanokit 5g Meridian Medical 1170427001 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $915.00 $1,001.61 No Bid $1,643.87 -

95 Detergent/disinfectant, alcohol-free, 32oz Spray Sanizide Plus 34810 Ea 6.9800$                                 EIC-6371 $4.60 SAF34810 $4.43 $4.46 $4.8000 *Sold by case of 6 only ($28.80/case)
$4.05 -

96 Dextrose 50% 25gm, 50ml Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $2.89 BTM #D6648-02 $8.50 No Bid $14.75 -

97 Diltiazam (Cardizem) 25mg, 5mg/ml, 5ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $2.14 BTM #6013-10 $22.38 10/Box No Bid $1.75 -

98 Diphenhydramine (Benadryl) 50mg, 50mg/ml, 1ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $1.11 BTM #0376-25 $1.68 No Bid $1.40 -

99 Dopamine 400mg in Dextrose 5% 250ml Bag -$                                   no bid No Bid $13.79 BTM #118-2B0842EA $12.45 No Bid $21.95 -

100 Dressing, 12" x 30", sterile Dynarex 3532 Ea 0.7000$                                 EFA-1175 $0.75 MedSource MSOMS-GZM001 $0.91 $0.38 Sub; Moore Brand $1.1500 $0.63 KENTRON #771230 $0.83 Medsource, MS-GZM00150       

101 Dressing, 2" x 2", non-sterile Dynarex 3222 Ea 0.0048$                                 EFA-1017 $0.01 
Ardes EMPGF22821, sold 2/pk, 50pk/bx 
$1.03

$0.005 $1.15 Sub; Moore Brand, 200/bx $0.0044 *Sold by bag of 200 only ($.88/bg) $0.004 KENTRON #228111 $0.01 Dukal Corporation, 1042930

102 Dressing, 3" x 4", non-adhering, sterile (TELFA) Covidien 1050 Ea 0.1378$                                 EFA-104710 $0.05 Dynarex DYN3434, sold 100/bx $4.68 $0.15 $6.00 Sub; Moore Brand, 100/bx $0.1860
*Sold by box of 100 only ($18.60/box) Covidien 7643: 
dressing non-adh 3x4 telfa pad $0.06000 KENTRON #773401 $0.13 -

103 Dressing, 4" x 4", sterile Dynarex 3342 Ea 0.0596$                                 EFA-1034 $0.02 
Ardes EMPGF44821, sold 2/pk, 25pk/bx 
$1.22

$0.07 $3.80 Sub; Moore Brand, 100/bx $0.0600 *Sold by box of 25 only ($1.50/box) $0.0550 KENTRON #KS4480 $0.06 -

104 Dressing, 5" x 9", sterile Covidien 7196D Tray/36 5.1000$                                 EFA-106004 $2.81 Dynarex DYN3501, sold 20/bx $1.56 $5.14 $1.67 Sub; Moore Brand, 25/bx $0.0830
*Sold by box of 20 only ($1.66/box) Dynarex 
3501: gauze pad ABD 5x9 $1.69 KENTRON #777590, 20/TRAY $3.64 Medsource, MS-ABD5X9        

105 Dressing, Veni-Gard, IV, adult ConMed 705-4431 Box/100 33.1400$                               EFA-3505 $20.00 Dynarex DYN4609 $37.92 $44.44 $37.7100 $32.69 CONMED 705-4431 $42.22 -

106 ECG Cable for LP15, Precordial Leads Physio-Control 11111-000022 Ea -$                                   11110-000022 $131.36 PHC11111-000022 $126.44 $122.00 $136.0000 $149.00 11111-000022 $114.39 -

107 ECG Cable for LP15, Trunk with Limb Leads Physio-Control 11111-000018 Ea 306.4100$                             EDI-318715 $326.80 PHC11111-000018 $307.70 $302.79 $336.0000 $359.00 11111-000018 $307.71 -

108 ECG Cable, Quik-Combo Therapy for LP15 Physio-Control 11113-000004 Ea 321.3000$                             EDI-318601 $341.45 PHC11113-000004 $320.94 $315.81 $337.1400 $379.00 1113-000004 $320.95 -

109 ECG electrode, adult Ambu SP-00-S/50 Bag/50 12.5800$                               Edi-313950 $12.47 AMBSP-00-S/50 $10.55 $11.75 $10.2900 $13.89 AMBU SP-00-S/50, 50/BAG $11.55 -

110 ECG electrode, pediatric/neonate, 3/pk ConMed 1620-003 Ea 4.6400$                                 EDI-310403 $0.15 CON1620-003, sold 3/pk, 10pk/bx $4.46 $0.17 $216.00 600/case $0.1700
*Sold by box only (3/pack, 10 pks/box) 
$5.10/box $0.70 PK OF 3, SOLD BY CASE ONLY $0.29 -

111 ECG electrode/pacing/defib, adult Covidien 1310P Ea 19.4500$                               EDI-319615-s $13.33 Conmed CON3112-1731 $14.22 BTM #16384 $18.8600 $34.89 $17.42 -

112 ECG electrode/pacing/defib, adult for LP500 Physio-Control 11996-000017 Ea 35.1200$                               EDI-3169 $18.88 Conmed CON2516M-PC $23.71 $21.50 $38.0200 $18.89 HEART SYNC #T100LO $22.59 -

113 ECG electrode/pacing/defib, pediatric for LP15 Physio-Control 11996-000093 Ea 36.9900$                               EDI-3172-S $17.77 Conmed CON2603M $24.46 $23.00 $40.7400 $17.69 HEART SYNC PED $24.23 -

114 ECG electrode/pacing/defib, pediatric for LP500 Physio-Control 11101-000016 Ea 94.1500$                               EDI-3169-P $76.30 PHC11101-000016 $63.96 $58.00 $99.5800 $122.00 $60.95 -

115 ECG paper for Lifepak, 3 channel, 100mm Covidien 31091427 Ea 3.6400$                                 EDI-3127 $1.77 Skintact LEO12394, sold 5/bx $8.85 $3.91 $64.00 $3.5700 *Sold by box of 3 rolls only ($10.71/box) $2.49 KENTRON #97432 $4.61 -

116 Epinephrine 1:10,000 1mg, 0.1mg/ml, 10ml Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $5.37 BTM #374921 $5.55 No Bid $9.46 -

117 Epinephrine 1:1000 1mg, 0.1mg/ml, 1ml Ampule -$                                   no bid No Bid $13.17 BTM #103-10 $8.54 No Bid $4.00 -

118 ET Introducer, Bougie, Coude Tip, Adult SunMed 9-0212-70 Ea 6.8400$                                 EAW-2353-S $3.95 SUN9-0212-70 $4.21 $8.20 Sub; Greenfield Medical $4.8100 $2.99 KENTRON #799915 $4.41 -

119 ET Introducer, Bougie, Coude Tip, Pediatric SunMed 9-0211-70 Ea 6.8400$                                 EAW-235320-S $3.95 SUN9-0211-70 $4.21 $8.20 Sub; Greenfield Medical $4.8100 $2.99 KENTRON #799910 $4.41 -

120 ET Tube Holder, Thomas, Adult Laerdal 600-10000 Ea 3.3063$                                 EAW-2338 $2.65 LAE600-10000 $2.76 $2.61 $2.5700 $2.39 KENTRON #699900 $2.49 -

121 ET Tube Holder, Thomas, Pediatric Laerdal 600-20000 Ea 3.5267$                                 EAW-2338-P $2.65 LAE600-20000 $2.76 $2.61 $2.5700 $2.39 KENTRON #699901 $2.49 -

122 Etomidate (Amidate) 20mg, 2mg/ml, 10ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $7.17 BTM #6695-01 $6.85 No Bid $10.80 -

123 Forceps, Magill, adult Ea 3.7500$                                 EAW-2360 $4.06 AME316 $3.42 BTM #400008 $3.25 $3.4300 Maco International 7338; forceps, Magill, adult $2.89 KENTRON #KI298 $3.22 -

124 Forceps, Magill, child Ea 3.7500$                                 EAW-2361 $3.72 AME315 $2.93 BTM #0128 $3.00 $3.4300 Maco International 7337; forceps, Magill, child $2.49 KENTRON #KI297 $3.22 -

125 Furosemide (Lasix) 100mg, 10mg/ml, 10ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $5.94 BTM #6102-10 $5.59 No Bid $10.40 -

126 Glove, Nitrile, High Risk, Large Microflex SEC-375-L Box 5.8200$                                 EGL-528603-S $5.42 
Digitcare APEXPro DIGAP12-3, sold 100/bx 
$10 84

$5.85 $7.25 $6.9300 $8.95 $6.94 -

127 Glove, Nitrile, High Risk, Medium Microflex SEC-375-M Box 5.8200$                                 EGL-528602-S $5.42 
Digitcare APEXPro DIGAP12-2, sold 100/bx 
$10.84

$5.85 $7.25 $6.9300 $8.95 $6.94 -

128 Glove, Nitrile, High Risk, Small Microflex SEC-375-S Box 5.8200$                                 EGL-528601-S $5.42 
Digitcare APEXPro DIGAP12-1, sold 100/bx 
$10.84

$5.85 $7.25 $6.9300 $8.95 $6.94 -

129 Glove, Nitrile, High Risk, X-Large Microflex SEC-375-XL Box 5.8200$                                 EGL-528604-S $5.42 
Digitcare APEXPro DIGAP12-4, sold 100/bx 
$10 84

$5.85 $7.25 $6.9300 $8.95 $6.94 -

130 Glove, Nitrile, High Risk, XX-Large Microflex SEC-375-XXL Box 5.8200$                                 EGL-528605-S $6.02 
Digitcare APEXPro DIGAP12-5, sold 90/bx 
$10.84

$5.85 $7.25 $6.9300 $8.95 $6.94 -

131 Glove, Nitrile, High Risk, XXX-Large Microflex SEC-375-XXXL Box 5.8200$                                 n/s $6.02 
Digitcare APEXPro DIGAP12-6, sold 90/bx 
$10.84

$5.85 $72.50 10bx/cs No Bid Not available in this size $8.95 $6.94 -

132 GlucaGen, 1mg/ml Bedford Laboratories 55390-004-01 Kit -$                                   no bid No Bid $349.00 BTM #7065-15 $345.87 No Bid $343.45 -

133 Haloperidol Lactate (Haldol) 5mg, 5mg/ml, 1ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $1.14 BTM #0426-12 $7.50 No Bid $2.60 -

134 Hydromorphone (Dilaudid) 2mg, 2mg/ml, 1ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $2.72 BTM #1312-30 No Bid $4.26 -

135 Immobilizer device, plastic w/2 straps Ambu 000264036 Ea -$                                   no bid $5.15 AMB000-264-036, sold 10/cs $51.50 $4.81 $3.51 $42.7700 $8.99 $4.14 -

136 Interosseous Driver for EZ-IO Teleflex 9058 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $319.00 EACH no bid -

137 Interosseous Needle, Adult, 25mm (Blue) Teleflex 9001-VC-005 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $119.00 MINIMUM PURCHASE OF 5 no bid -

138 Interosseous Needle, EZ Stabilizer Teleflex 9066-VC-005 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $16.99 MINIMUM PURCHASE OF 5 no bid -

139 Interosseous Needle, Large Adult, 45mm (Yellow) Teleflex 9079-VC-005 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $119.00 MINIMUM PURCHASE OF 5 no bid -

140 Interosseous Needle, Pediatric, 15mm (Pink) Teleflex 9018-VC-005 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $119.00 MINIMUM PURCHASE OF 5 no bid -

141 Ipratroprium Bromide 0.02%, 2.5ml, Individually 
Wrapped

Nephron Pharmaceuticals 0487-9801-01 Box/30 -$                                   no bid No Bid $5.99 $3.48 No Bid $5.94 -

142 Isolation Kits Morrison Medical 6300 Ea -$                                   no bid $5.63 MOR6300 $5.18 $5.75 $5.7400 $3.19 KENTRON #201117 $4.26 -

143 IV, 3-Way Stopcock w/Swivel Male Luer Lock Smiths Medical MX5311L Ea 0.7800$                                 EDI-305615 $0.69 PORMX5311L $0.75 $34.95 50/case $0.5500 $0.95 SMITHS MX9311L $0.69 -

144 IV, admin set, needleless, 15 drop, 2 sites, 86" BBraun US1150 Ea $1.67 BBMUS1150 $2.11 $1.53 B Braun; 83" $1.7700 $1.49 KENTRON #941150 $5.70 -

145 IV, admin set, needleless, 60 drop, 2 sites, 86" BBraun 352379A Ea $1.76 BBM352379A, sold 50/cs $88.00 $2.05 $1.41 B Braun; 83" $1.8500 $1.09 KENTRON #419060 $3.65 -

146 IV, armboard, padded, disposable, 3" x 9" Morrison Medical 56-1009 Ea 0.8000$                                 ESP-1009-S $0.51 Precision PRD45004-11-MPG $0.86 BTM #450004 $1.03 $0.8300 $1.39 MORRISON #1009-50, 50/CASE $0.81 -

147 IV, catheter, Protective Plus, 14g 1 1/4" Smiths Medical 3068 Ea 72.6700$                               EDI-3000-PP $1.65 POR306801 $1.76 $90.00 50/Box $1.3794 Sold by box of 50 only ($68.97/box) $1.47 $1.43 -

148 IV, catheter, Protective Plus, 16g 1 1/4" Smiths Medical 3062 Ea 72.6700$                               EDI-3001-PP $1.65 POR306201 $1.76 $90.00 50/Box $1.3794 Sold by box of 50 only ($68.97/box) $1.47 $1.43 -

149 IV, catheter, Protective Plus, 18g 1 1/4" Smiths Medical 3065 Ea 72.6700$                               EDI-3002-PP $1.65 POR306501 $1.76 $90.00 50/Box $1.3794 Sold by box of 50 only ($68.97/box) $1.47 $1.43 -



150 IV, catheter, Protective Plus, 20g 1" Smiths Medical 3067 Ea 72.6700$                               EDI-3003-PP1 $1.65 POR306701 $1.76 $90.00 50/Box $1.3794 Sold by box of 50 only ($68.97/box) $1.47 $1.43 -

151 IV, catheter, Protective Plus, 22g 1" Smiths Medical 3060 Ea 72.6700$                               EDI-3004-PP $1.65 POR306001 $1.76 $90.00 50/Box $1.3794 Sold by box of 50 only ($68.97/box) $1.47 $1.43 -

152 IV, catheter, Protective Plus, 24g 3/4" Smiths Medical 3063 Ea 72.6700$                               EDI-3005-PP $1.65 POR306301 $1.76 $90.00 50/Box $1.3794 Sold by box of 50 only ($68.97/box) $1.47 $1.43 -

153 IV, Extension Set for Nitrogylcerin, 61" BBraun 471973 Ea -$                                   no bid $1.80 BBM471973, sold 100/cs $180.00 $2.10 No Bid $2.06 -

154 IV, Extension Set w/Connector, 6.5" BBraun 473444 Ea -$                                   no bid $2.02 BBM473444 $2.16 $2.00 $1.8324 Sold by case of 100 only ($183.24/CS) $0.89 KENTRON #429006 $2.34 -

155 IV, Partial Additive Bag, Empty, 150 mL BBraun S5904-52 Bag -$                                   no bid $2.08 BBMS5904-52, sold 48/cs $99.84 $0.00 No Bid $92.36 48/Case No Bid $3.82 -

156 IV, pressure infusor, w/gauge, disp, 1000ml Vital Signs IN900012 Ea 7.9900$                                 EDI-3258 $22.72 VITIN900012, sold 12/cs $272.64 $10.80 $15.00 Sub; Sunmed $10.5700
Ethox Medical 4010: Infuser pressure disp, 
1000ml $7.39 KENTRON #888802 $10.35 -

157 IV, Rate Flow Regulator BBraun 375173 Ea -$                                   no bid $4.32 BBM375173, sold 50/cs $216.00 $5.06 $4.90 No Bid $8.98 SOLD BY CASE ONLY $6.38 -

158 IV, vial access cannula (Blue) Becton-Dickinson 303367 Ea 33.5000$                               EDI-3270 $0.31 B/D3033367, sold 100/bx, 10bx/cs $311.00 $0.34 $31.11 100/box $0.3217 Sold by box of 100 only ($32.17/box) $0.79 $0.31 -

159 Kedrick Extrication Device, w/straps, bag, 500lb Ferno-Washington IE1250 Ea -$                                   no bid $53.69 MedSource MSOMS-ED2253 $109.00 BTM #660030 $120.00 $114.8600 $54.69 KENTRON #881213 $88.50 -

160 Laerdal Compact Suction Unit, 300ml Laerdal 88006101 Ea 512.1300$                             EAW-227104 $424.37 LAE88006101 $399.99 $412.13 $419.7100 $549.00 $405.05 -

161 Laerdal Suction Unit, 1200ml Laerdal 78002001 Ea 892.3600$                             EAW-2268 $747.35 LAE78002001 $766.90 $743.00 $739.1400 $979.00 $713.31 -

162 Laryngoscope, blade, stainless, Macintosh #1 Rusch 008601100 Ea 10.6000$                               
EAW-2601 $6.92 MedSource MSOMS-46011 $36.00 $11.50 Sub; ADC $33.1500 $6.99 KENTRON #MC26001 $9.49 Maco Intl, E4462-11         

163 Laryngoscope, blade, stainless, Macintosh #2 Rusch 008602200 Ea 10.6000$                               
EAW-2602 $6.92 MedSource MSOMS-46012 $36.00 $11.50 Sub; ADC $33.1500 $6.99 KENTRON #MC26002 $9.49 Maco Intl, E4462-12         

164 Laryngoscope, blade, stainless, Macintosh #3 Rusch 008603300 Ea 10.6000$                               
EAW-2603 $6.92 MedSource MSOMS-46013 $36.00 $11.50 Sub; ADC $33.1500 $6.99 KENTRON #MC26003 $9.49 Maco Intl, E4462-13         

165 Laryngoscope, blade, stainless, Macintosh #4 Rusch 008604400 Ea 10.6000$                               
EAW-2604 $6.92 MedSource MSOMS-46014 $36.00 $11.50 Sub; ADC $33.1500 $6.99 KENTRON #MC26004 $9.49 Maco Intl, E4462-14         

166 Laryngoscope, blade, stainless, Miller #0 Rusch 008615050 Ea 10.6000$                               EAW-2605 $6.92 MedSource MSOMS-46020 $36.00 $11.50 Sub; ADC $33.1500 $6.99 KENTRON #ML25000 $9.49 Maco Intl, E6226-10         

167 Laryngoscope, blade, stainless, Miller #1 Rusch 008616100 Ea 10.6000$                               EAW-2606 $6.92 MedSource MSOMS-46021 $36.00 $11.50 Sub; ADC $33.1500 $6.99 KENTRON #ML25001 $9.49 Maco Intl, E6226-11         

168 Laryngoscope, blade, stainless, Miller #2 Rusch 008617200 Ea 10.6000$                               EAW-2607 $6.92 MedSource MSOMS-46022 $36.00 $11.50 Sub; ADC $33.1500 $6.99 KENTRON #ML25002 $9.49 Maco Intl, E6226-12         

169 Laryngoscope, blade, stainless, Miller #3 Rusch 008618300 Ea 10.6000$                               EAW-2608 $6.92 MedSource MSOMS-46023 $36.00 $11.50 Sub; ADC $33.1500 $6.99 KENTRON #ML25003 $9.49 Maco Intl, E6226-13         

170 Laryngoscope, blade, stainless, Miller #4 Rusch 008619400 Ea 18.9000$                               EAW-2609 $6.92 MedSource MSOMS-46024 $36.00 $11.50 Sub; ADC $33.1500 $6.99 KENTRON #ML25004 $9.49 Maco Intl, E6226-14         

171 Laryngoscope, handle, chrome, medium/standard Rusch 008621000 Ea 19.9000$                               EAW-2611 $9.23 MedSource MSOMS-46000 $24.29 $7.72 Sub; ADC $22.8700 $7.95 KENTRON #LH15000C $9.49 Maco Intl, 7862

172 Laryngoscope, handle, chrome, small/penlight Rusch 008620100 Ea 17.4500$                               EAW-2610 $9.23 MedSource MSOMS-46001 $24.29 $7.72 Sub; ADC $22.8700 $7.95 KENTRON #LH15000A $9.49 Maco Intl, 7861

173 Laryngoscope, replacement bulb, large Rusch 008628300 Ea 1.5400$                                 EAW-2619 $1.16 Sunmed SUN5-0234-04 $1.87 $1.77 $1.3900 $0.92 KENTRON #LB1100 $1.54 -

174 Laryngoscope, replacement bulb, small Rusch 008629100 Ea 1.5400$                                 EAW-2618 $1.16 Sunmed SUN5-0234-01 $1.94 $1.85 $1.8400 $0.92 KENTRON #LB1000 $1.54 -

175 Lubricant, Water Soluable, 2.7gm PDI T00137 Ea 0.0624$                                 EFA-4173 $0.04 Dynarex DYN1250, sold 144/bx $5.76 $0.06 $4.56 Sub; Dynarx 144/bx $0.0340
Proadvantage P903100 Lubricating Jelly Packet, 3gm, Sterile, 
144/bx sold by box of 144 packs only ($4.97/box) $0.04 DYNAREX #1250 $0.06 -

176 Mask, Surgical w/o faceshield Kimberly-Clark 47107 Ea -$                                   no bid $0.19 K/C47107, sold 40/bx $7.44 $0.20 $4.85 Sub; Moore Brand, 50/bx No Bid $0.0590 DYNAREX #2201 $0.83 -

177 Methylprednisone Sod. Suc. (Solu-Medrol) 125 mg, 2 vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $11.37 BTM #0047-22 $273.48 25/bx No Bid $17.95 -

178 Midazolam (Versed) 5mg/ml 1ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $1.42 BTM #371113 No Bid $4.78 -

179 Mucosal Atomizer Device Wolf Tory Medical MAD301 Ea 5.0500$                                 EAW-202020 $5.40 WLFMAD300 $4.93 $5.55 $5.4300 $4.19 TELEFLEX MAD 300 $3.95 -

180 Naloxone (Narcan), 2mg, 1mg/ml, 2ml Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $33.59 BTM #373369 $36.75 No Bid $66.04 -

181 Needle, Filter, Blunt, 18g x 1 1/2" (Red) Becton-Dickinson 305211 Ea 0.1645$                                 EDI-326310 $0.32 B/D305211, sold 100/bx $31.56 $0.34 $315.67 1000/case $0.2047
Covidien 8881305117 Filter Needle 18G x 1 1/2" *Sold 
by box of 100 only ($20.47) $0.22 B.BRAUN #415030 $0.31 -

182 Needle, Safety 23g x 1" Covidien 8881850310 Ea 0.2430$                                 EDI-339212 $0.23 KEN8881850310, sold 50/bx $11.48 $0.25 $8.56 50/Box $11.5400
$0.22 -

183 NIBP cuff for LP15, adult Physio-Control 11160-000005 Ea 13.9800$                               EDI-732600 $25.56 PHC11160-000015 $25.24 BTM #2615-16015 $23.33 $28.0000 $8.95 KENTRON #177710S $8.71 -

184 NIBP cuff for LP15, child Physio-Control 11160-000003 Ea 10.0900$                               EDI-732602 $20.45 PHC11160-000013 $7.83 BTM #2614-16014 $18.67 $21.7100 $7.95 KENTRON #177709S $7.39 -

185 NIBP cuff for LP15, large adult Physio-Control 11160-000007 Ea 15.7400$                               EDI-732604 $28.12 PHC11160-000017 $27.68 BTM #2615-16017 $25.67 $30.8600 $12.69 KENTRON #177712S $8.71 -

186 NIBP tubing, Coiled, 2-9 feet Physio-Control 21300-007300 Ea -$                                   no bid $52.84 PHC21300-008148 $49.29 $50.47 $51.4300 $42.95 KENTRON # $46.63 -

187 Nitroglycerin 0.4mg, 100 count, tablets Bottle/100 -$                                   no bid No Bid $45.99 BTM #0436-01 $63.65 No Bid $46.00 -

188 Nitroglycerin in D5W, 25mg, 250ml Bottle Bottle -$                                   no bid No Bid $19.96 BTM #118-1A0692EA No Bid $31.96 -

189 O2 connector, nipple/nut (xmas tree), emerald green Ea 0.3400$                                 EAW-2238 $0.40 SUN8-2311-50, sold 50/bg $20.00 $0.26 BTM #11187 $1.90 $0.4400 Sunmed 8-2311-50 $0.29 KENTRON #550000 $0.43 -

190 O2 cylinder, "D" tank, aluminum, w/toggle Ea 55.2500$                               EAW-2813 $51.20 MEPK870MDT $58.91 BTM #10011 $46.67 $47.9400 Mada Medical 1502E $42.95 OXYDT $49.44 -

191 O2 cylinder, Jumbo "D" tank, aluminum, w/toggle Ea 79.6300$                               EAW-2811 $79.29 MEPK870MJDT $76.32 BTM #D4151 $78.62 $84.5100 Mada Medical 1502IED $64.95 OXYJDT $74.63 -

192 O2 cylinder, replacement toggle handle with pin Meret KTR Ea 4.4500$                                 EAW-28291099 $1.72 MEPKTR $2.19 $2.08 $1.7000 $8.95 KENTRON #550022 $1.83 -

193 O2 flowmeter, click-style, 0-25LPM Precision Medical 7MFA1105TC Ea -$                                   no bid $49.32 PRM7MFA1105TC $45.59 $55.12 $47.4100 $18.69 KENTRON #555125 $43.64 -

194 O2 flowmeter, tube, 1-15 lpm with Ohio male Q.D. Precision Medical 1MFA Ea -$                                   no bid $39.55 PRM1MFA1005 $24.95 $38.0100 *1MFA1005 $24.69 KENTRON #556125OH $30.37 -

195 O2 mask, partial non-rebreather, infant Teleflex 396218 Ea -$                                   no bid $0.89 Ventlab, VEN2301 $1.02 $1.92 $0.8600 $0.72 KENTRON #999120 $0.71 Medsource, MS-25059         

196 O2 mask, partial non-rebreather, pediatric Teleflex 1058 Ea 1.6200$                                 EAW-2009-hd $0.67 Ventlab, VEN2201 $1.02 $0.93 $0.9500 $0.63 KENTRON #999110 $1.04 Medsource, MS-25058         

197 O2 mask, total non-rebreather, adult Teleflex 1060 Ea 1.1000$                                 EAW-2011-hd $0.66 Ventlab, VEN2102 $1.09 $0.93 $0.9500 $0.61 KENTRON #999108 $0.64 Medsource, MS-25060         

198 O2 nasal cannula, curved, flared, adult Teleflex 1103 Ea 0.5100$                                 eaw-2000-hd $0.24 Ventlab, VEN1007 $0.33 $0.30 $0.3100 $0.19 KENTRON #999308 $0.18 Henry Schein, C0204          

199 O2 nasal cannula, curved, flared, pediatric Teleflex 1838 Ea 1.7500$                                 eaw-2001-hd $0.35 Ventlab, VEN1207 $1.26 BTM #D6134 No Bid $0.4600 $0.23 KENTRON #999312 $0.18 Henry Schein, C0202          

200 O2 nebulizer, w/tubing, mouthpc, tee, 5" flex tube Misty-Neb 2438 Ea 0.8900$                                 EAW-202402-HD $0.75 MedSource MSOMS-22883 $1.63 BTM #533-MS-22885EA $1.00 Misty; MFG # 2434 $0.6700 $0.61 KENTRON #333759 $0.69 Medsource, MS-22883         

201 O2 regulator, brass, 0-25 lpm, with gauge, hose barb 
outlet

Allied Healthcare Products L370-220-R Ea -$                                   no bid $194.73 ALLL370-220-R $188.00 $119.51 $181.3400 $119.00 KENTRON #870225BR $164.94 -

202 O2 regulator, fixed flow with gauge, 2 check valves Life Support Products L106-260 Ea 159.4100$                             EAW-280106 $163.79 ALLL106-260 $145.80 $151.83 $152.5300 $79.00 KENTRON #540B2CV $138.10 -

203 OB kit Dynarex 4902 Ea 6.4000$                                 EFA-539900 $4.78 Motion Medical MMD1702 $5.65 $6.75 Sub; Busse $5.7100 $3.99 KENTRON #999700 $5.81 DMS Holdings, 650-4001-0000      

204 Ondansetron (Zofran) 4mg, 2mg/ml, 2ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $0.50 BTM #4755-02 $12.99 25/bx No Bid $2.32 -

205 Pad, prep, alcohol, 1 ply, large 200/box Covidien 5033 Box 1.6000$                                 EFA-4150-k $2.36 KEN5033 $2.56 $2.31 $1.19 KENTRON #650-16 $2.53 -

206 Penlight, disposable, w/pupil gauge Ea 0.6250$                                 EMI-7120 $0.55 VRD14-823 $1.25 BTM #066-356WP $3.61 6/pack $0.6600 $0.49 KENTRON #404060 $0.70 -

207 Pillow, disposable, 18" x 24" Medline Industries 1824-15 Ea 3.9800$                                 EIC-5103 $2.15 Careline CAR089-7015 $2.48 $2.3400 $1.89 KENTRON #182412D $2.52 -

208 Pneumothorax Kit, Turkel, 8.0 Fr catheter, 15G needle Covidien 566034 Ea -$                                   no bid $39.99 KEN566034, sold 20/cs $799.80 $41.48 $39.11 $5.0280 *Sold by box of 20 only ($100.56/box)
$37.16 -

209 QuickTrach for adults Rusch 120900040 Kit 139.2600$                             EAW-245010 $126.59 TEL120900040 $135.19 $128.05 $127.3100 $122.95 $166.50 -

210 Razor, prep, weighted Medline Industries DYND70837 Ea 0.2091$                                 EMI-9213 $0.39 MEDDYND70837, sold 100/cs $38.63 $0.21 $24.74 100/case $0.2500 $0.16 KENTRON #992222 $0.17 -

211 Respirator, N95, Duckbill, Universal Kimberly-Clark PFR95 Ea 0.7086$                                 EIC-515503 $0.83 3M, 3/M1870+, sold 20/bx $16.50 $0.75 BTM #16624 $0.7180
Kimberly Clark Mask N95 Fluidshield PFR95 Respirator & Surg 
Mask *Sold by box of 35 only ($25.13/box)

$0.67 -

212 Respirator, N95, Molded, Large Innovel 1513-N95 Ea 1.2550$                                 EIC-515603 $1.12 MOL1513N95, sold 20/bx $22.40 $0.94 $17.61 20/bx $1.0700
Air Gas MOL1511: Mask N95 Respirator & Surgical Large 
*Sold by case of 160 only ($171.20/cs)

$0.84 -

213 Respirator, N95, Molded, Medium Innovel 1512-N95 Ea 1.2550$                                 EIC-515602 $1.12 MOL1512N95, sold 20/bx $22.40 $0.94 $17.61 20/bx $1.0700
Air Gas MOL1511: Mask N95 Respirator & Surgical 
Medium *Sold by case of 160 only ($171.20/cs)

$0.84 -

214 Respirator, N95, Molded, Small Innovel 1511-N95 Ea 1.2550$                                 EIC-515601 $1.12 MOL1511N95, sold 20/bx $22.40 $0.94 $17.61 20/bx $1.0700
Air Gas MOL1511: Mask N95 Respirator & Surgical Sm 
*Sold by case of 160 only ($171.20/cs)

$0.84 -

215 Resuscitator, adult Ambu 520211000 Ea 9.9800$                                 EAW-2715 $10.35 AMB520-211-000 $9.10 $9.42 $9.4400 $6.99 KENTRON #779500 $9.11 -

216 Resuscitator, infant Ambu 540212000 Ea 15.9600$                               EAW-271715 $13.35 AMB540-212-000 $10.54 $12.54 $12.5150 *Sold by case of 12 only ($150.18/cs) $6,99 KENTRON #779502 $12.08 -

217 Resuscitator, pediatric Ambu 530213000 Ea 16.4100$                               EAW-271503 $13.35 AMB530-213-000 $10.54 $12.54 $12.5200 $6.99 KENTRON #779501 $12.08 -

218 Rocuronium (Zemuron) 50mg, 10mg/ml, 5ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $5.93 BTM #9558-05 $33.00 10/Box No Bid $5.66 -

219 Scissors, Trauma, 7 1/4" Ea 0.7000$                                 emi-7260 $0.75 MSOMS-SH001B $1.69 BTM #K4202 $1.00 $0.9700 $0.64 KENTRON #KI14107 $0.83 -

220 Scoop Stretcher w/ straps, Aluminum Ferno-Washington 65 Ea 968.4500$                             EBB-4904 $387.78 MedSource MSOMS-SCP123 $408.89 BTM #660818 $1,040.00 $454.2900 $269.00 KENTRON #843311 $320.40 -

221 Sensor Extension Cable, Masimo Rainbow, 3' Masimo 11171-000037 Ea no bid $230.75 PHC11171-0000374 $215.56 $198.07 $85.7100 $169.00 $116.10 -

222 Sensor, Masimo Rainbow, Adhesive, Neo-L Masimo 11996-000341 Ea -$                                   no bid $63.63 PHC11996-000341, sold 10/bx $636.30 $55.73 $540.41 10/Box No Bid $62.50 $55.21 -

223 Sensor, Masimo Rainbow, Adhesive, Pediatric Masimo 11996-000340 Ea -$                                   no bid $659.10 PHC11996-000340 $57.83 No Bid $74.69 $54.61 -

224 Sensor, Masimo Rainbow, Reusable, Adult Masimo 11171-000049 Ea -$                                   no bid $579.10 PHC11171-000049 $536.66 $520.93 $657.1400 $689.00 $634.17 -

225 Sensor, Masimo SpO2, Adhesive, Neonate-L Masimo 11171-000042 Ea -$                                   no bid $18.79 PHC11171-000042, sold 20/bx $375.80 $18.73 $559.30 10/Box No Bid $18.95 $13.20 -



226 Sensor, Masimo SpO2, Adhesive, Pediatric Masimo 11171-000040 Ea 12.9400$                               EDI-704301-S $15.90 PHC11171-000040, sold 20/bx $318.00 $14.00 $269.83 20/bx No Bid $14.95 $11.62 -

227 Sensor, Masimo SpO2, Reusable, Adult Masimo 11171-000046 Ea 200.0000$                             EDI-705030 $273.63 PHC11171-000046 $249.41 $245.00 No Bid $249.00 $105.55 -

228 Sharps container, 1qt plastic red Covidien 8900SA Ea 1.8500$                                 EIC-3517 $1.63 KEN8900SA $1.69 $1.59 $1.6300 $1.39 KENTRON #412276R $1.51 -

229 Sharps container, 8qt clear-lid Becton-Dickinson 305344 Ea 7.9600$                                 EIC-3539 $5.27 B/D305344 $5.66 $5.13 $5.3200 $3.79 KENTRON #412207R $2.12 -

230 Sodium Bicarbonate 8.4% 50ml Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $12.76 BTM #371035 $10.12 No Bid $16.61 -

231 Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 1000ml Bag Bag -$                                   no bid No Bid $2.32 BTM #7800-09 $5.88 No Bid $7.99 B.BRAUN, BAXTER, HOSPIRA $3.90 -

232 Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 10ml Flush Ea -$                                   no bid $0.29 WEL1210-BP, sold 100/bx $28.94 $1.78 BTM #374888 $46.28 100/box No Bid $0.45 BD #306546-PACKING 30/BOX $0.32 -

233 Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 250ml Bag Bag -$                                   no bid No Bid $2.26 BTM #358002 $5.88 No Bid $2.89 B.BRAUN, BAXTER, HOSPIRA $3.80 -

234 Splint, SAM, 4 1/2" x 36", orange/blue SAM Medical Products SP1121 Ea 7.9500$                                 ESP-6335-OR $2.99 Dynarex Actisplint, DYN3528 $7.03 $6.67 *ROLLED* $2.39 KENTRON #887722 $4.44 Medsource, MS-SPLINT        

235 Splint, traction, adult Dyna-Med SI008 Ea 315.2000$                             ESP-3130 $138.00 Faretec QD4, FAR1126514 $349.00 $253.95 $228.5600 $118.79 KENTRON #222888 $99.21 Faretec, Inc, 1123516

236 Splint, traction, pediatric Faretec QD-3 Ea 199.4500$                             ESP-3132 $138.00 FAR1126512 $349.00 BTM #SI008P $146.60 $140.5700 $118.79 KENTRON #222999 $135.66 -

237 Stethoscope, adult, black ADC 603BK Ea 5.7000$                                 EDI-7370-BK $23.97 AME603BK $24.23 $6.25 $30.5600 $5.89 KENTRON #108810BK $75.84 -

238 Stethoscope, pediatric, pink ADC 604P Ea 6.3000$                                 EDI-7373-PK $23.97 AME604P $32.31 $3.98 $30.1000 $5.89 KENTRON #108940PK $27.80 -

239 Strap, 2 pc, 5', loop end, Metal Push Buckle, Nylon, 
Black

DMS 1200-BK Ea 6.8500$                                 EST-1200-BL $6.25 DKM11152BK $9.11 BTM #D02814BK $1.78 $6.2500 *This is product code for Morrison Medical $5.29 KENTRON #323605B $7.08 -

240 Strap, 2 pc, 5', loop end, Plastic Side Release, 
Polypropylene, White

DMS 47152-WH Ea 1.5800$                                 47152 $1.52 DKM47152WH $1.84 $1.6000 $1.29 KENTRON #293305W $1.49 Medsource, MS-ST696-3        

241 Strap, KED chin and forehead Ea 8.2500$                                 EBB-4662 No Bid $34.50 BTM #FER0819928 $38.07 $6.8600
Head and chin straps for Optimum & Optimum 
Plus vest (KED) $4.25 KENTRON #881214 $32.05 -

242 Strap, padded, thick foam, double strap limb holder Posey 2520 Ea 3.5000$                                 est-1114 $3.16 Dick Medical DKM501110 $5.38 $3.52 Sub; Moore Brand $6.1900 $3.19 DICK MEDICAL 501100 $4.54 -

243 Succinylcholine (Quelicin) 200mg, 20mg/ml, 10ml vial -$                                   no bid No Bid $24.03 BTM #375204 $31.00 No Bid $37.19 -

244 Suction catheter, 06fr, whistle tip w/control Covidien 30620 Ea 0.4400$                                 EAW-2201-K $0.17 Dynarex DYN4806 $0.44 $0.41 $0.4200 $0.13 KENTRON #393506 $0.21 Medsource, MS-SC06         

245 Suction catheter, 08fr, whistle tip w/control Covidien 30820 Ea 0.4400$                                 EAW-2202-K $0.17 Dynarex DYN4808 $0.44 $0.41 $0.4200 $0.13 KENTRON #393508 $0.21 Medsource, MS-SC08         

246 Suction catheter, 10fr, whistle tip w/control Covidien 31020 Ea 1.0200$                                 EAW-2203-K $0.17 Dynarex DYN4810 $0.38 $0.34 $0.3500 $0.13 KENTRON #393510 $0.21 Medsource, MS-SC10         

247 Suction catheter, 12fr, whistle tip w/control Covidien 31220 Ea 1.0200$                                 EAW-2204-K $0.17 Dynarex DYN4812 $0.38 $0.34 $0.3500 $0.13 KENTRON #393512 $0.21 Medsource, MS-SC12         

248 Suction catheter, 14fr, whistle tip w/control Covidien 31420 Ea 0.3700$                                 EAW-2205-K $0.17 Dynarex DYN4814 $0.38 $0.34 $0.3500 $0.13 KENTRON #393514 $0.21 Medsource, MS-SC14         

249 Suction catheter, 16fr, whistle tip w/control Covidien 31620 Ea 1.0200$                                 EAW-2206-K $0.17 Dynarex DYN4816 $0.38 $0.34 $0.3500 $0.13 KENTRON #393516 $0.21 Medsource, MS-SC16         

250 Suction catheter, 18fr, whistle tip w/control Covidien 31820 Ea 0.3700$                                 EAW-2207-K $0.17 Dynarex DYN4818 $0.38 $0.34 $0.3500 $0.13 KENTRON #393518 $0.33 -

251 Suction instrument, Yankauer, bulb tip, w/o vent ConMed 0034920 Ea 1.8400$                                 EAW-2208 $0.34 Dynarex DYN4691 $1.94 $8.29 $1.7100 $0.34 KENTRON #887711 $0.51 Medsource, MS-YK40         

252 Suction unit, replacement canister, 300cc Laerdal 886100 Ea 17.4000$                               EAW-227105 $12.78 LAE886100 $13.97 $12.41 $12.6400 $16.89 $11.45 -

253 Suction unit, replacement cannister w/ lid, 1200cc Bemis 484410 Ea 2.9600$                                 EAW-2220 $2.61 DYN4675 $2.86 $2.90 $3.0900 $2.74 $2.85 -

254 Suction, nasogastric, salem sump, 06fr Covidien 8888268060 Ea 6.2500$                                 EAW-2487 $5.99 KEN8888268060 $6.24 $5.86 $6.0300
$0.72 -

255 Suction, nasogastric, salem sump, 10fr Covidien 8888264911 Ea 1.7900$                                 EAW-2489 $1.73 KEN8888264911 $1.81 $1.69 $1.7400
$2.11 Medovations Inc., 1217-10         

256 Suction, nasogastric, salem sump, 12fr Covidien 8888264929 Ea 1.7900$                                 EAW-2490 $1.73 KEN8888264929 $1.81 $1.69 $1.7400
$1.61 -

257 Suction, nasogastric, salem sump, 14fr Covidien 8888264945 Ea 1.7900$                                 EAW-2491 $1.73 KEN8888264945 $1.81 $1.69 $1.7400
$2.11 Medovations Inc., 1217-14         

258 Suction, nasogastric, salem sump, 18fr Covidien 8888264986 Ea 1.7900$                                 EAW-2493 $1.73 KEN8888264986 $1.81 $1.69 $1.7400
$2.11 Medovations Inc., 1217-18         

259 Swabsticks, Benzoin, 1s Dynarex S42450 Ea 0.2970$                                 EFA-416602 $0.09 DYN1201, sold 50/bx $4.60 $0.20 $8.94 Sub; PDI, 50/bx $0.1870 *Sold by box of 50 only ($9.35/box)
$0.18 -

260 Swabsticks, Povidone/Iodine, 3s Dynarex 1202 Ea 0.0633$                                 EFA-4161 $0.06 DYN1202, sold 25pk/bx $4.60 $0.07 $4.34 25/bx No Bid $0.23 -

261 Syringe and Needle, 1cc, LL, 25g x 5/8" Becton-Dickinson 305780 Ea -$                                   no bid $0.38 B/D305780, sold 50/sp $19.05 $0.38 BTM #35305903 $19.60 50/Box No Bid $0.20 Covidien, 8881501160

262 Syringe, Catheter tip, 60cc Becton-Dickinson 309620 Ea -$                                   no bid $0.85 B/D309620, sold 40/bx $34.00 $0.88 $33.11 40/bx $0.8540 *Sold by case of 160 only ($136.64/cs)
$0.79 -

263 Syringe, Luer-Lok tip, 05cc Becton-Dickinson 309646 Ea -$                                   no bid $0.06 Dynarex DYN6989, sold 100/bx $5.75 $0.11 $12.56 125/bx $0.0945
EXEL 26230 Syringe, Luer Lock, 5-6cc, with cap 
*Sold by box of 100 only ($9.45/box)

$0.04 Henry Schein, 904477

264 Syringe, Luer-Lok tip, 10cc Becton-Dickinson 309604 Ea -$                                   no bid $0.06 Dynarex DYN6990, sold 100/bx $5.75 $0.11 $21.49 200/bx $0.1079 *Sold by box of 100 only ($10.79/box)
$0.05 Henry Schein, 904476

265 Syringe, Luer-Lok tip, 20cc Becton-Dickinson 302830 Ea -$                                   no bid $0.16 Dynarex, DYN6991, sold 50/bx $8.00 $0.25 BTM #1633-20720 $13.07 48/bx $0.2210
EXEL 26280 Syringe, Luer Lock, 20-25cc, with cap 
*Sold by box of 50 only ($11.05/box)

$0.06 Henry Schein, 1126151

266 Syringe, Luer-Lok tip, 60cc Becton-Dickinson 309653 Ea -$                                   no bid $0.34 Dynarex, DYN6993, sold 25/bx $8.50 $0.52 $18.58 40/bx $0.1917 *Sold by box of 40 only ($19.17/box)
$0.13 Henry Schein, 1126152

267 Tape, cloth/silk, 1" 3M 1538-1 Ea 0.8750$                                 EFA-1146 $9.48 3M, 3/M1538-1, sold 12/bx $.79 $1.06 $11.16 12/bx $0.9650 *Sold by box of 12 only ($11.58/box) $0.57 KENTRON #705211 $0.90 -

268 Tape, plastic, 1" 3M 1527-1 Ea 0.8000$                                 EFA-115601 $0.85 3M, 3/M1527-1, sold 12/bx $10.20 $1.27 $13.59 12/bx $1.1700 *Sold by box of 12 only ($14.04/box) $0.47 KENTRON #705311 $0.52 -

269 Thermometer WelchAllyn SureTemp Plus 690 Ea 280.6500$                             EDI-7469 $238.63 W/A01690-200 $255.00 BTM #179200 $250.00 $240.0000 $208.99 $231.61 -

270 Thermometer Probe Covers for SureTemp WelchAllyn 05031 Box/25 11.5400$                               EDI-7456 $0.88 W/A05031-750 $0.96 $8.56 250/bx $0.03552 *Sold by box of 250 only ($8.88/box) $0.95 $8.13 -

271 Thermometer Probe, Oral WelchAllyn 02893-000 Ea 85.1200$                               EDI-746910 $72.38 W/A02893-000 $76.18 $72.39 $72.8000 $78.79 $65.76 -

272 Thermometer Probe, Rectal WelchAllyn 02892-000 Ea 82.2500$                               EDI-746911 $72.38 W/A02892-000 $76.18 $72.39 $72.8000 $78.79 $65.76 -

273 Tourniquet, Combat Application
North American Rescue 
Products

30-0023 Ea 22.7400$                               EFA-351520-BK $22.71 NAR30-0023 $22.16 $21.00 $21.2600 $23.49 $22.17 -

274 Tourniquet, latex free, 1" x 18" x 0.025", flat Dynarex 3139 Ea 0.0752$                                 EFA-350140 $0.10 DYN3139, sold 250/bx $24.25 $0.18 BTM #16662 $0.15 $0.0850 *Sold by pack of 10 only ($.85/pack) $0.08 KENTRON #901100 $0.08 ADI Medical, 10907

275 Triage tag, bar coded, Florida SERT
Disaster Management 
Systems

DMS-05006F Ea -$                                   no bid $57.67 DISDMS-05006F $1.06 $1.0070 *Sold by pack of 50 only ($50.35/pack)
$1.02 -

276 Tyvek, Bootie Dupont TY454S-WH-SR Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $2.16 BTM #294267 $52.77 100/box No Bid $1.56 -

277 Tyvek, Sleeve Lakeland Industries 850-18 Ea -$                                   no bid No Bid $0.38 BTM #484-850 $66.46 200/bx No Bid $0.40 Precept Medical, 35 2502         

278 Urinal, plastic, male, w/cover, 1 quart Medline Industries DYND80234 Ea 0.6000$                                 EFA-4514 $0.34 Medegen ACTH140-01 $0.50 BTM #1072-23519 $0.48 Sub:  Medgen $0.4800 $0.79 KENTRON #201103 $0.47 -

279 Wash basin, plastic, 8 quart, mauve Medline Industries DYND80347 Ea 0.7000$                                 EFA-4511 $0.48 Medegen ACTH362-10 $0.56 $0.76 $0.6200 $0.95 KENTRON #201102M $0.65 -

280 Water for Irrigation, Sterile, USP 250ml Bottle Baxter 2F7112 Ea -$                                   no bid $1.25 Nurse Assist WEL6260 $2.67 $2.25 No Bid $2.39 McKESSON # $10.00 -

281 Wipe, Germicidal Disposable Cloth, Bleach PDI P54072 Ea 10.6500$                               EIC-411300 $0.11 NICP54072, sold 75/bt $7.95 $0.11 $7.56 $7.8590 *Sold by case of 12 canisters only ($94.31/cs)
$0.11 -
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