Price Quote Form (PQF)- Motor Vehicles

Contract No.: 25100000-16-1.

Updated: 6/1/2017

(STATE AGENCIES MUST ALSO SUBMIT MP6301)

Important - Contractor's must select Vendor Name, Vehicle Group (Drop Down), and Line No. for the sheet to work.

Formulas are included in the BLUE and YELLOW shaded columns (auto-calculate)

Please complete only the unshaded white cells

Awarded Contractor Information

Vendor Name: (Drop Down)

Garber Ford Inc.

Street Address:

3380 Highway 17

City, State, Zip:

Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

Contact Person: Ryan Davis [Title: Fleet Sales
Original Quote Date: 8/7/2017 [ Revised Quote Date: Est. Delivery: | 90-120 Days
Phone #'s: |Primary: 904-264-2442 Secondary:
Email Address: rdavis@garberautomall.com
Fax #: 904-284-0054
Requesting Agency Information
Agency Name: City of North Port
Contact Person: Judith Fauly [Title: Fleet Asset Technician

Phone #'s:

941.240.8540

Email Address:

jfauly@cityofnorthport.com

Fax #:

Secondary Contact for Agency: (optional)

Contact Person:

[Title:

Phone #'s:

Email Address:

Fax #:

Comliwhgsciiic(::ode Vehicle Group (Drop Down) Line No. Sub Group
25101505 Group 3: Minivans Or Vans 104 Sub-Group B: VAN, CARGO
Representative Model Description Base Vehicle Price OEM Options Discount %
2018 Ford Transit Van T-250 148" EL Hi Rf 9000 GVWR Sliding RH Dr (R3X) 26,487.00 4.00%
Manufactu.rer s A MSRP OEM Options Total Discount Option Total Cost with
OEM Option Description - _ _
Sttt it Discount % Dollars Applied Discount
Code(s)

101A ORDER CODE 101A $ - 0 $ o $ o

99M ENGINE: 3.7L TI-VCT V6 -inc: SEIC capability $ - 0 $ - $ =

446 TRANSMISSION: 6-SPEED AUTOMATIC W/OD & SELECTSHIFT $ - 0 $ o $ o

X41 4.10 AXLE RATIO $ - 0 $ o $ o

YZ OXFORD WHITE $ - 0 $ o $ o

VK PEWTER, VINYL FRONT BUCKET SEATS $ - 0 $ o $ o
53B HEAVY-DUTY TRAILER TOW PACKAGE $ 485.00 4.00% $ 1940 | $ 465.60
17B FIXED REAR-DOOR/FIXED PASS-SIDE CARGO-DOOR GLASS $ 250.00 4.00% $ 10.00 | $ 240.00
92E PRIVACY GLASS $ 400.00 4.00% $ 16.00 | $ 384.00

153 FRONT LICENSE PLATE BRACKET $ - 0 $ o $ o

T&D TEMPORARY TAG AND DELIVERY $ - 0 $ o $ o

0 $ = $ =

0 $ = $ =

0 $ = $ =

2018 Carryover Pricing; 2018 Model at 2017 Contract Price 0 $ = $ =

0 $ = $ =

0 $ = $ =

0 $ = $ =

0 $ = $ =

0 $ = $ =
TOTAL COST: OEM OPTIONS $ 4540 | $ 1,089.60
SUB-TOTAL $ 27,576.60



mailto:rdavis@garberautomall.com
mailto:jfauly@cityofnorthport.com

Identified

Aftermarket Description MSRP MSRP Discount | Total Discount Option _TotaI_Cost with
. St it % Dollars Applied Discount
Option(s)
$ $ S
$ $ S
$ $ S
$ $ S
$ $ S
$ $ =
$ $ =
TOTAL COST: IDENTIFIED AFTERMARKET OPTIONS $ = $ =
Non-Identified - MSRP MSRP Discount | Total Discount Option Total Cost with
Aftermarket Description ) }
. St Hit % Dollars Applied Discount
Option(s)
$ = $ =
3K THIRD KEY AND KEY FOB $ 176.00 $ = $ 176.00
4C WHELEN 4-CORNER LED STROBES (Clear Flange Mount) $ 396.00 $ = $ 396.00
INSTALL 1 HOUR LABOR FOR INSTALL WITH CAB MOUNTED SWITCH $ 105.00 $ = $ 105.00
KMT KARGO MASTER CUSTOM SHELF KIT -inc.: $ 5,385.00 $ = $ 5,385.00
S1IM2HC2PM BULKHEAD PARTITION with WKC1FDTH HIGH ROOF WING MOUNT KIT $ o $ =
HAD4459 HYBRID SHELF UNITS x3 $ = $ =
#9 4 DRAWER UNIT $ = $ =
#919 3 DRAWER COMBOS x3 $ = $ =
BR36212 BLUE BIN SET $ o $ -
TAIWAD 4 HOOK BAR $ o $ -
DK4210 DOOR KIT $ o $ -
CL1446R CABINET LOCKER $ o $ -
RK148FTHE RAIL MOUNT KIT $ o $ o
TINT TINT FRONT WINDOWS TO MATCH REAR $ 136.00 $ o $ 136.00
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
$ = $ =
TOTAL COST: NON-IDENTIFIED AFTERMARKET OPTIONS $ o $ 6,198.00
GRAND TOTAL PER REPRESENTATIVE MODEL $ 33,774.60
Additional Savings Off Contract Price Per Vehicle* (Please provide detailed information in Vendor Comments) $0.00
Total Vehicles Quoted (Drop Down) 1
PO GRAND TOTAL $33,774.60
Additional Savings for Example: Quantity, Dealer Special, Customer Picked Up Vehicle. Ex: DMS negotiated $50 off of contract price for XYZ vehicle due
to large order.
Vendor
Comments:
Please confirm vehicle color. If no color is specified then the default is white.
Agency
Comments:

*UNSPSC = United Nations Standard Products and Services Commodity Code

Revised 08-2015 DMS




ATTACHMENT D.3 - v:nm mn.m& - Mini <m:m or Vans

Commodity Code No. 25101505; MINI VANS OR VANS

Updated 5/2M17

To review more information about EPA Fuel Economy Please Go To: https:/lwww fueleconomy.gov/

Identified Aftermarket Options™
Alternate Base Vehicle |OEM Options| Estimated
Manutacturer! u A ]
sus-aroup’ ER st ctest | i o Pinte Representative Modef® ey Grganization Name® Price (S####4.00)| Discount | Leaditime In | Vant  Rain Shiakda,| 5 (0/880 | mogeieer) it
Capabla (#%)" | Doys (eez)’” | ElongsMoumed, On, Price. EE
Price (fo.809)
(Sz.008)
78 (2017 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-150 130" Med Rf 8600 GVWR Dual Dr (E4D) o |—Gadarfonling it 2= LT ElS ot S0L0 S oS8
Duval Ford LLC, $21,990.00 5% 7084 5 160.00 | § 460.00 | § 495.00
79  |2917 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-150 148" Low Rf 8600 GVWWR Swing-OutRH Dr o Garber Ford, Inc, $21,639.00 5% 120 s 20000 | 5 200.00 | § 695.00
(ESZ) Duval Ford LLC. $21,639.00 5% 7084 5 160,00 | § 160.00 | § 495.00
- 4 Sarber Ford, Inc, 0. .
30 (2017 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-150 145" Low Rf 3500 GVWWR Sliding RHDr (2] | o STEED o e L 200A0% % 20001115 £33 00
Duval Ford LLC, $21.814.00 6% 70-84 5 160.00 | § 160.00 | § 495.00
81 |2017 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-150 148 Med R 8600 GVWR Sliding RH Dr (£2C) o s i) e gal = sl L 2000113 5500
Duval Ford LLC, $22.940.00 4% 70-84 s 160.00 | § 160.00 | § 495,00
Garbor Ford, Inc, . .
82 [2017 Ford Traneit Cargo Van T-150 148" Med Rf 8500 GYWR Dual Dr (E2D) o Sesse Y i RS 200.00;1.9 200.00; ¢ 52500
Duval Ford LLC, S2TAGTH0 5% 70-84 s 160.00 | § 160.00 | 5 495.00
85 |2017 Ram ProMaster Cargo Van 1500 Low Roof 1137 WE {VFIL11) AstoNation COJR Pembroke Pines $24.524.00 0% 90-120 No Bid No Bid | § 745.00
Ram, 86 2017 Ram ProMaster Cargo Van 1500 Low Roof 136" WB (VFiL12) AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 526,052.00 0% 0-120 No Bid NoBid | § 745.00
872017 Ram ProMaster Cargo Van 1500 High Roof 136 WB (VF1L13) ZutoNation COJR Pambroke Pings: 526878,00 0% 0-120 No Bid NoBid | 5 745,00
_wnhc._u.s. w_..mu nﬂaa = 38 2017 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van RWD 2500 135" (CG23405) 0 Alan Jay Chovrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $21,650.00 GA £0-180 s 189.00 | § 183.00 | § 597.00
S AR VY 80 [2017 Chevrolet Express Cargo Van RWD 2500 155" (CG23705) ) Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadilla S23.346400 % 50-180 | S 189.00 | 5 189,00 | 597,00
54 2017 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-250 1307 Low R 9000 GVWR Swing-Out RH Dr. o Garbor Ford, Ing, 52171400 6% 120 S 20000 | S 200,00 | 5 695.00
(R1Z) Duval Ford LLC, S2L71400 5% 30-120 NoBid | S 106.00 | 5 486.00
5 o o Garber Ford, Ing, . .
35 2017 Ford Transit Cargo Van T:250 130" Low Rf 000 GVWR Sliding RHDr (R1Y)|  © ! Selfey b 1i0E 8,43 nouaLs 20000 113 633,00
Duval Ford LLC, S21.864.00 5% 90120 NoBid | § 106.00 | $ 436.00
96 [2017 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-250 130" Med Rf 9000 GVWR Siding RHDr(R1¢)| 0 Tt il o 22098 s 2000015 St
Duval Ford LLC, $22.240.00 T% 90-120 NoBid | § 106.00 | 3 496.00
& Garber Ford, Inc, A
97  |2017 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-250 1307 Med Rf 3000 GVWR. Dual Dr (R1D) o AL, it ex s J R0l el ol
Duval Ford LLC. S22796.00 4% 30-120 NoBid | 5 106,00 | § 495.00
g [2017 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-250 145" Low Rf 9000 GVWR Swing-Out RH Dr 5 Duval Ford LLC, 52244000 &% 120 s 20000 | § 20000 | § 695,00
{R2Z) Garber Ford, Inc, $22,441.00 4% 90-120 NoBid | § 106.00 | $ 496,00
99 2017 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-250 148™ Low Rf 9000 GVWR Sliding RH Dr (R2Y) [¢] DQuval Ford g, SEhet AN 2 2l 4 20005 15 2000} 1 B25.00
Ford Barber Ford. Inc, $22.585.00 4% 30-120 NoBid | § 106.00 | § 496.00
100|207 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-250 1487 Med Rf 3000 GVWR Stiding RH Dr [R2C) o Il i i) < 20000145 R HI £and
Garber Ford, Inc, $23,668.00 4% 90-120 NoBid [ 5 106,00 | 5 496.00
s Duyal Ford LLC, 524.304.00 4% 120 s 20000 | 5 200.00 [ § 695.00
101 Ford Transit Van T-250 148 00 GVWR Dual D o
EaE Tt Gamo Med BEaD FEED) ‘Garber Ford, Inc, 52430400 % 50-120 NoBid | 5 106.00 | 5 456.00
F. 525,461.00 3% 50120 NoBid [ 5 106.00 | § 496,00
102 |2017 Ford Transit Van T-250 148" Hi Rf 9000 GVWR Sliding RH D o —Gaberfording -
CxsaVan SRR Duyal Ford LLG 2546100 3% 708 |5 160.00 | § 160.00 | § 49500
Sarber Ford, Inc, 52291100 A
103 |2017 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-250 148 Hi Rf 9000 GVWR Dual Dr (R2U) ] Duval Ford LLC, 52291100 5% 120 5 20000 [ 5 200.00 | § 695.00
qo4  |2037 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-250 148" EL Hi Rf 5000 GVWR Sliding RH Dr & Duval Ford LLC. S26r7.00 4% 120 B 20000 | § 200.00 | § £95.00
(R3X) Garber Ford, Ing, \[ s26as700 ) 4% 20-120 NoBid | § 106.00 | § 495,00
. : Duval Ford LLC, —STrmTEY 5% 120 s 20000 [ § 200.00 | § 635.00
20 it Cal Vi a 0 ual
105 17 Ford Transit Cargo Van T-250 148" EL Hi Rf 9000 GVWR Dual Dr (R3U) o S = i il il =
106 [2016 Freightliner Sprinter 2500 Standard Roof 144" (F2CA144) Tampa Truck Gonter LLG 535,376.00 3% 120 No Bid No Bid | § 750,00
107 [2016 Freightliner Sprinter 2500 Kigh Roof 144" (F2CA144) Tampa Truck Contor LLC 537,646,00 3% 120 No Bid No Bid | § 750,00
108 |2016 Freightliner Sprinter 2500 High Roof 170" (F2CA170) Tampa Truck Conter LLC S41.076.00 3% 120 No Bid No Bid | § 750.00
109 |2016 Frei Sprinter 2500 High Roof 170" EXT [F2CA170E) Tampa Truck Centor LG 542.205.00 2% 120 No Bid NoBid | § 750,00
110 [2016 Freightliner Sprinter Crew 2500 Standard Roof 164" (F2CV144) Tampa Truck Center LLC S37.579.00 3% 120 No Bid NoBid | § 750.00
111 [2016 Freightliner Sprinter Crow 2500 High Roof 144" (F2CV144) S40,149.00 3% 120 No Bid NoBid | § 750.00
112 |2016 Freightliner Sprinter Crow 2500 High Roof 170" (F2CV170) SH2,665.00 3 120 No Bid No Bid | § 750.00
ahe 113__|2017 GMC Savana Cargo Van RWD 2500 135" (TG23405) o S2L.650.00 5% 50-180 [ 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
115 |2017 GMC Savana Cargo Van RWD 2500 155 (TG23705) o 523,346.00 5% 50130 [ 5 189.00 | § 189.00 | § 597.00
127 |2017 Ram ProMaster Cargo Van 2500 High Roof 136" WB (VF2L13) $27,760.00 0% 90-120 No Bid NoBid | $ 745.00
o~ 1286|2017 Ram ProMaster Cargo Van 2500 High Roof 159" WB {VF2L15) 529,283.00 0% 50-120 No Bid NoBid [ § 745.00

Pagado!?




Prepared By:
administrator

2017 Ford Transit Van
R3X T-250 148" EL Hi Rf 9000 GVWR Sliding RH Dr

Phote may not represent exact vehicle or selected equipment.




Prepared By:
administralor

2017 Fleet/Non-Retail Ford Transit Van T-250 148" EL Hi Rf 9000 GVWR Sli
SELECTED MODEL & OPTIONS

SELECTED MODEL - 2017 Fleet/Non-Rotall R3X T-250 148" EL Hi RT 9000 GVWR Sliding RH Dr

st e P A LA e T

FPR— b Tetavrert g U W O v T L

Caode Description MSRP
R3X 2017 Ford Transit Van T-250 148" EL Hi Rf $38,040.00

9000 GVWR Sliding RH Br

e e e e e P T T AL L S P T R LT A Bt

SELECTED VEH[GLE COLORS 2017 Fleethon-Reta:[ ?33)( T-250 148” EL Hl Rf 9000 GVWR Sitdmg RH Dr

e g I A P

Code . Dascription
- Intetior: Pewter

- Exterior 1: Oxford White

- Exterior 2: No color has been selected,

PR R S SN PVIF PO PSESPRTNY

s LEGTED OPT"l‘oi\ss 2017 FEeeUNDmReta]l R3X T-250 148" EL Hi R 9000 GVWR Si[dmg RH or

CATEGORY

Code Description MSRP
ENGINE

99M ENGINE: 3.7L TI-VCT V6 -inc: SFIC capabiiity (STD) INC
TRANSMISSION

4486 TRANSMISSION: 6-5PEED AUTOMATI(‘ WIOD & SELECTSHIFT {(STD) $0.00
OPTION PACKAGE

101A ORDER CODE 101A $0.00
AXLE RATIO

X41 4.10 AXLE RATIO (STD) $0.0C
PRIMARY PAINT

YZ OXFORD WHITE $0.00
PAINT SCHEME

STANDARD PAINT $0.00

SEAT TYPE

VK PEWTER, VINYL FRONT BUCKET SEATS $0.00

Report content is based on current data version referenced. Any performance-relaled calculations are offered solely as
guidelines. Actual unit performance will depend on your operaling conditiens.

GM AutoBook, Data Version;  471.0, Data updated 12/27/2018
@ Copyright 1986-2012 Chrome Data Solutions, LP, Al rights reserved.
Customer File:
January 03, 2017 2:00:16 PM Page 2




Prepared By:
administrator

2017 Fleet/Non-Retail Ford Transit Van T-250 148" EL Hi Rf 9000 GVWR Slii
SELECT ED MODEL & OPTIONS

SELECTED opmns 2017 Fleethon RetaII R3X. T»250 148" EL Hi Rf 9000 GVWR Sliding RH Dr

[P FEI e R " e

CATEGORY

Code Besoription MS3RP.
SEATING ARRANGEMENT

216G DUAL BUCKET SEATS -inc: 2-way manual (fore/aftirecling) driver and $0.00

front-passenger seats and driver-side armrest, Doas NOT include heated
seats (STD)

ADD!)BOM)&S EQUIPMENT et
538 HEAVY-DUTY TRAILER TOW PACKAGE ~ing: 4-pin/7-pin conhector, f’ $485 00

»__‘:w,a. electric brake confroller tap-in capability and refay system for s
backup/B+/running lights, Frame Mounted Hitch Receiver, Tow/Haul
Mode w/Trailering Wiring Provisions, trailer wiring harness to rear of
vehicle for upfit, trailer stabilily confrol {TSC), 4/7 pin conneclor assembly
and rear jumper
598 TOW/HAUL MODE W/TRAILERING WIRING PROVISIONS -ine: trailer INC
wiring harmess to rear of vehicle for upfit, trailer stability control {TSC),
i AT pin connector assembly and rear jumper oy,
ij;@,f FIXED REAR-DOOR/FIXED PASS-SIDE CARGQO-DOOR LASS C&EEEO 00
57N REAR-WINDOW DEFOGGER (Requires 17A or 17B or 17F or 17G or INC
et QO FY ey
(, 92E .~ PRIVACY GLASS -inc: RearnWsndow Defogger (Requires 17A or 178 or $400 00 ./
e 7 or 176)
153 FRONT LICENSE PLATE BRACKET Standard in states requirlng two $0.00
license plates and optional in all others. _
OPTIONS TOTAL $1,135.00

Report content is based on current data version referenced. Any performance-related calculations are offered solely as
guidelines. Actual unlt performance will depend on your aperating conditions,

GM AutoBook, Data Varsion:  471.0, Data updated 12/27/2016
@ Copyright 1986-2012 Chrome Data Solutions, LP. Allrighis reserved,
Customer Flle:
January 03, 2017 2:.00:18 PM " Page 3




Prepared By:
administrator

2017 Fleet/Non-Retail Ford Transit Van T-260 148" EL Hi Rf 9000 GVWR Sli
PR!CING‘ SUMMARY

PRICING SUMWEARY 2017 Fieet!Non-Retaif R3X T-250 148" EL Hl Rf 9000 GVWR S!lcimg RH Dr

SRP
Base Price $38,040.00
Total Options: $1,135.00
Vehicle Subtotal $39,175.00
Advert/Adjustments $0.00
Destination Gharge $1,185.00
GRAND TOTAL T $40,370.00

Reporl content is based on cwrent data version referenced. Any performance-elated caloulations are offered solely as
guidelines, Actual unit performance will depend on your operating conditions,

GM AutoBook, Data Version:  471.0, Data updated 12/27/2016
© Copyright 1986-2012 Chrome Data Solutions, LP, All rights reserved.
Customer File:

January 03, 2017 2:00:16 PM Page 4
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